










































































































































































 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

 

DEPARTMENT:   Public Works      ACTION REQUESTED: Ordinance  

SUBJECT:  Stop intersections for the Highlands Development 

PREPARED BY:  Darin Pryor 

ATTACHMENTS:  Ordinance, Map 

 (CASE/PROJECT #)       MEETING DATE: April 6, 2026 
___________________________________________________________________________________ 
 

Overview: Traffic control for the new roads in the Highlands Development needs established by ordinance.  A 

map is included in the packet depicting where the new stop intersection would be located. 

 

Background information: Council approved the ordinance to establish the Planned Unit Development 

in the Highlands in August of 2024.  Community Development staff began issuing temporary occupancy 

permits for some of the developed lots the week of 2-23-26.     

 

 

Fiscal considerations: $1050 in signs and posts. 

 

 

 

Recommendation:  Staff is requesting the final reading of an ordinance establishing the stop controlled 

intersections in the Highlands Development. 

Page 86



ORDINANCE NO. __________ 
 
AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTION 27-89 OF THE GENERAL ORDINANCES OF 
THE CITY OF ROLLA, MISSOURI, KNOWN AS THE CODE OF THE CITY, 
PERTAINING TO STOP INTERSECTIONS. 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
ROLLA, MISSOURI AS FOLLOWS: 
 
       Section 1:  That Section 27-89, Stop intersections - Enumerated generally, of the 
General Ordinances of the City of Rolla, Missouri, known as the Code of the City is 
hereby amended by adding the following in alphabetical order: 

 
Sec. 27-89. Stop intersections - Enumerated generally. 
 
The driver of a vehicle shall cause his vehicle to come to a full and complete 
stop before entering the intersections named below, and he shall then 
proceed cautiously, yielding the right of way to any pedestrian within any 
crosswalk adjacent to the intersection and to any vehicle either in the 
intersection or approaching so closely thereto, when not required to stop, 
as to constitute an immediate hazard.  At those intersections labeled "Yield," 
the driver of a vehicle shall yield the right of way to any vehicle in either the 
intersection or approaching so closely thereto, when not required to stop, 
as to constitute an immediate hazard.  
 
Clover Lane, at Osage Drive  
 
Castle Hill Drive, at Clover Lane and Heatherfield Drive 

 
Hillside Court, at Heatherfield Drive 
 
Heatherfield Drive, at Highway 72 
 
Longview Lane, at Heatherfield Drive 
 
 

Section 2:  That this ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after the date of 
its passage and approval.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 87



Ordinance No. __________ 
Page 2 of 2 
 

PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ROLLA, MISSOURI, AND 
APPROVED BY THE MAYOR THIS 6TH DAY OF APRIL, 2026. 
 
       APPROVED: 
 
 
 
              
       MAYOR 
 
ATTEST:  
 
 
       
CITY CLERK 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
__________________________   
CITY COUNSELOR 

Page 88



Page 89



 

 

 
 
 

 
CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

 

DEPARTMENT:   Public Works     ACTION REQUESTED: Ordinance Final Reading 

SUBJECT:  No Parking for the Highlands Development 

PREPARED BY:  Darin Pryor 

ATTACHMENTS:  Ordinance, Map 

 (CASE/PROJECT #)       MEETING DATE: April 6th, 2026 
___________________________________________________________________________________ 
 

Overview: No Parking areas for the new roads in the Highlands Development needs established by ordinance.  
A map is included in the packet depicting where the new No Parking areas would be established. 

 

Background information: Council approved the ordinance to establish the Planned Unit Development 
in the Highlands in August of 2024.  Community Development staff began issuing temporary occupancy 
permits for some of the developed lots the week of 2-23-26.     
 
 
Fiscal considerations: None 
 
 
 
Recommendation:  Staff is requesting the first reading of an ordinance establishing the No Parking 
areas in the Highlands Development. 

Page 90



              ORDINANCE NO. __________ 
 
AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTION 27-92  OF THE GENERAL ORDINANCES OF THE 
CITY OF ROLLA, MISSOURI KNOWN AS THE CODE OF THE CITY RELATING TO 
PARKING.         
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
ROLLA, MISSOURI AS FOLLOWS: 
 

 
Section 1: That Section 27-92 of the Code of the City of Rolla, Missouri, pertaining to parking is 
hereby amended by adding the following in alphabetical order:   
 

Sec. 27-92 Parking Prohibited – On certain streets or parts of streets.  
 
It shall be unlawful for any person to cause or permit any motor vehicle registered in 
his/her name to be unlawfully parked as set out in this section. 
 
Clover Lane, on the East side, from Osage Drive to Longview Lane.  
 
Castle Hill Drive, on the South side, from a point two hundred feet West of the intersection 
of Clover Lane to Heatherfield Drive.  
 
Longview Lane, on the South side, from Clover Lane to Heatherfield Drive.  
 
Heatherfield Drive, on the North side, from a point two hundred feet West of the 
intersection of Longview Lane to Highway 72.  
 
 

 
Section 2:  That this ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after the date of its passage 
and approval.   

   
PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ROLLA, MISSOURI, AND APPROVED 
BY THE MAYOR THIS 6th  DAY OF April, 2026. 
 
        APPROVED: 
 
         
        ______________________________________ 
ATTEST:       MAYOR 
 
 
______________________________________ 
CITY CLERK 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
______________________________________ 
CITY COUNSELOR 

Page 91



Page 92



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

 

DEPARTMENT:   Public Works      ACTION REQUESTED:  Ordinance 

SUBJECT:  Project 609 – 2026 Asphalt Phase II 

PREPARED BY:  Darin Pryor 

ATTACHMENTS:  Contract 

 (CASE/PROJECT #)  609     MEETING DATE: April 6, 2026 
___________________________________________________________________________________ 
Overview: City staff received bids for the 2026 Asphalt Phase II project. The bids were as follows:  

Pierce Asphalt, LLC  .................................................................................................................  $ 872,350.30 

PO Box 696 

Rolla, MO  65402 

 

Capital Paving & Construction, LLC  ........................................................................................  $ 967,283.40 

130 Scott Station Road 

Jefferson City, MO 65109 

 

NB West Contracting Company  .............................................................................................  $ 894,683.00 

18637 US Highway 66 

Pacific, MO 63069 

 

This bid is for milling and overlaying the asphalt pavement of approximately 3.5 miles of various city 

streets.     

 

Background information:  The work included in this project is Phase II of the asphalt street 

maintenance scheduled for FY26.  Streets in this phase include: 10th Street, Britt Lane, Casey Lane, 

Condo Drive, Ella Court, Fairgrounds Road, Kadison Court, Lanning Lane, Little Oaks Road, Rolla Street, 

Sycamore Drive, Timber Creek Road, & White Columns Drive. 

 

Fiscal considerations: The adopted FY 26 budget appropriated $1,000,000 of $2.5M for this project 

under Capital Expenditures - Asphalt.  Phase I encumbered $810,300.  

 

Recommendation:  Staff is requesting the final reading of the ordinance authorizing the Mayor to 

enter into the contract with Pierce Asphalt, LLC for  $872,350.30. Page 93



 

 

 

 

 

ORDINANCE NO. ____________ 
 

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO EXECUTE A CERTAIN 
AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE CITY OF ROLLA, MISSOURI, AND PIERCE ASPHALT, 
LLC. 
 
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ROLLA, MISSOURI, AS 
FOLLOWS: 
 
 Section 1:  That the Mayor of the City of Rolla, Missouri be and is hereby authorized 
and directed to execute on behalf of the City of Rolla, Missouri an agreement between 
the City of Rolla and Pierce Asphalt, LLC, a copy of said agreement being attached hereto 
and marked Exhibit “A”. 
 

Section 2:  This ordinance will be in full force and effect from and after the date of 
its passage and approval. 
 
PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ROLLA, MISSOURI AND 
APPROVED BY THE MAYOR THIS 6TH DAY OF APRIL 2026. 
 
       APPROVED: 
 
 
 
              
       MAYOR 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 
      
CITY CLERK 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
 
      
CITY COUNSELOR 
 

Page 94



 19 

CONTRACT AGREEMENT 

THIS AGREEMENT, made and entered into this  Day of  by and 
between the City of Rolla, Missouri, Party of the First Part and hereinafter called Owner, 
and  

Party of the second Part and 
hereinafter called the Contractor. 

WITNESSETH: 

THAT WHEREAS, the Owner has caused to be prepared, in accordance with law, 
specifications, plans, and other Contract Documents for the work herein described, and 
has approved and adopted said documents, and has caused to be published and advertised 
for and in connection with the construction of: FY 2026 Asphalt Phase II, PROJECT 
609, in complete accord with the Contract Documents and the said plans and 
specifications; and 

WHEREAS, the said Contractor, in response to such advertisement, has submitted to the 
Owner, in the manner and at the time specified, a sealed proposal in accordance with the 
terms of said advertisement; and 

WHEREAS, the Owner, in the manner prescribed by law, has publicly opened, examined 
and canvassed the proposals submitted in response to the published invitation therefore, 
and as a result of such canvass has determined and declared the aforesaid Contractor to 
be lowest and best bidder for the said work and has duly awarded to the said Contractor a 
contract therefore, for the sum or sums named in the Contractor’s proposal, a copy 
thereof being attached to and made a part of this contract. 

NOW THEREFORE, in consideration of the compensation to be paid to the Contractor 
and of the mutual agreement herein contained, the parties to these presents have agreed 
and hereby agree, the Owner for itself and its successors, and the Contractor for itself, 
himself, or themselves, or its, his or their successors and assigns, or its, his, or their 
executors and administrators, as follows: 

ARTICLE I.  That the Contractor shall (a) furnish all tools, equipment, supplies, 
superintendent, transportation, and other construction accessories, services and facilities; 
(b) furnish all materials, supplies, and equipment specified and required to be
incorporated in, and form a permanent part of the completed work except the items
specified to be furnished by the Owner; (c) provide and perform all necessary labor, and
(d) in a good, substantial, and workmanlike manner, and in accordance with the
provisions of the General Conditions and the Special Conditions of the Contract, which
are attached hereto and made a part hereof, and in conformity with the Contract Plans and
Specifications designated and identified therein, execute, construct, and complete all
work included in, and covered by the Owner’s official award of this Contract to the said

EXHIBIT "A"

Pierce Asphalt, LLC

Page 95



 20 

Contractor, such award being based on the acceptance by the Owner of the Contractor’s 
proposal, for the construction of  FY 2026 Asphalt Phase II, PROJECT 609. 

It is further stipulated that not less than the prevailing hourly rate of wages as found by 
the Department of Labor and Industrial Relations of the State of Missouri, or determined 
by the Court of Appeal shall be paid to all workers performing work under this Contract. 

ARTICLE II.  Contractor acknowledges that Section 285.530, R.S.Mo, prohibits any 
business entity or employer from knowingly employing, hiring for employment, or 
continuing to employ an unauthorized alien to perform work within the State of Missouri. 
Contractor therefore covenants that it is not knowingly in violation of Subsection 1 of 
Section 285.530, R.S.Mo, and that it will not knowingly employ, hire for employment, or 
continue to employ any unauthorized aliens to perform work on the Project, and that its 
employees are lawfully eligible to work in the United States. 

ARTICLE III.  Occupational Safety and Health Administration (OSHA) 
Safety Training: 
a. Contractor shall provide a ten (10) hour Occupational Safety and Health

Administration (OSHA) construction safety program for all employees who will
be on-site at the project.  The construction safety program shall include a course
in construction safety and health that is approved by OSHA or a similar program
approved by the Missouri Department of Labor and Industrial Relations which is
at least as stringent as an approved OSHA program as required by Section
292.675, R.S.Mo.

b. Contractor shall require its on-site employees to complete a construction safety
program within sixty (60) days after the date work on the project commences.

c. Contractor acknowledges and agrees that any of Contractor’s employees found on
the project site without the documentation of the successful completion of a
construction safety program shall be required to produce such documentation
within twenty (20) days, or will be subject to removal from the project.

d. Contractor shall require all of its subcontractors to comply with the requirements
of this Section and Section 292.675, R.S.Mo.

Notice of Penalties for Failure to Provide Safety Training 
a. Pursuant to Section 292.675, R.S.Mo, Contractor shall forfeit to City as a penalty

two thousand five hundred dollars ($2,500.00), plus one hundred dollars
($100.00) for each on-site employee employed by Contractor or its Subcontractor,
for each calendar day, or portion thereof, such on-site employee is employed
without the construction safety training required in Safety Training section of
Article III above.

b. The penalty described in above subsection A of this section shall not begin to
accrue until the time periods described in Sections B and C Safety Training of
Article III above have elapsed.

c. Violations of Article III – Safety Training above and imposition of the penalty
described in this Section shall be investigated and determined by the Missouri
Department of Labor and Industrial Relations.

Page 96



 21 

for 

ARTICLE IV.  That the Contractor shall construct and complete the work designated 
and described in the foregoing proposal and attached specifications in accordance with 
the Notice to Bidders, Instruction to Bidders, Proposal, Bond, General Conditions, 
Special Conditions, Technical Specifications, Drawings, Addenda, and other component 
parts of the Contract Documents hereto attached, all of which documents from the 
Contract and are as fully a part hereto as if repeated verbatim herein. 

ARTICLE V.  That the Owner shall pay to the Contractor for the performance of the 
work described as follows:  Complete construction of the improvements in accordance 
with plans and specifications; and the Contractor will accept as full compensation 
therefore, the sum (subject to  
adjustment as provided by the Contract) of                      $ 872,350.30
All work covered by and included in the contract award and designated in the foregoing 
Article I.  Payment therefore shall be made in the manner provided in the General 
Conditions attached hereto. 

ARTICLE VI.  That the Contractor shall begin assembly of materials and equipment 
within ten (10) days after receipt from the Owner of executed copies of the Contract.   

Liquidated Damages - Should the contractor fail to complete the work on or before the 
completion date specified the contractor will be charged liquidated damages in the 
amount of $500.00 per calendar day for each full calendar day that the work is not fully 
completed.  Liquidated damages will not be charged for weekends and holidays. 

ARTICLE VII.  Before the final payment can be made to the Contractor on the project, 
the Contractor must complete and return the Affidavit Compliance with the Prevailing 
Wage Law form furnished at the end of the Special Conditions section. 

ARTICLE VIII.  Before the final payment can be made on the project to the Contractor, 
the Contractor must complete and return the Contractor’s Affidavit Regarding Settlement 
of Claims form furnished at the end of the Special Conditions section. 

ARTICLE IX.  This Contract will not be binding and effective until confirmed by the 
Owner. 

Page 97



 22  

IN WITNESS-WHEREOF:  The parties have executed this Contract as of the day and 
year first above written. 
 
CITY OF ROLLA, MISSOURI  CONTRACTOR 

BY   BY  
Mayor, Owner, Party of the First Part  
    
   
Printed Name   Printed Name/Title 

STATE OF MISSOURI ) 
SS ) 
County of Phelps ) 
 
On this  day of  before me appeared  , 
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, did say that he is the Mayor of 
the City of Rolla, Missouri, a municipal corporation, and the seal affixed to said 
instrument is the corporate seal of said municipal corporation and that said instrument is 
the corporate seal of said municipal corporation and that said instrument was signed 
under authority of the City Council of  
of the City of Rolla, Missouri; and the said  Acknowledged  
said instrument to be the free act and deed of said municipal corporation. 
 
My commission expires:  
 

Notary Public 
 
STATE OF MISSOURI ) 
SS ) 
County of Phelps ) 
 
On this  day of  before me appeared  , 
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, did say that (s)he is the  
of  
and that the seal affixed to said instrument is the corporate seal of said corporation by 
authority  
of its board of directors; and the said  acknowledged said 
instrument to be the free act and deed of said corporation. 
 
My commission expires:  
 

Notary Public 

Page 98



P
age 99

mkreyling
Line



 

  

 

   
 

CITY OF ROLLA 
CITY COUNCIL AGENDA  

DEPARTMENT HEAD:  Dawn Bell, Community Development Director    

ACTION REQUESTED: Resolution                                        

ITEM/SUBJECT:  Resolution of support for adoption of the Rolla 2050 Comprehensive Plan 

BUDGET APPROPRIATION: NA                   DATE:  April 6, 2026 

 
Commentary:   

The previous comprehensive plan for the City of Rolla was completed in 1996, with an update 
performed in 2005. A comprehensive plan is intended to serve as a guiding vision for the city over the 
next ten to twenty years. It provides a foundation for current planning and serves as the primary policy 
guide for transportation, sustainability, community infrastructure, and decisions regarding zoning, 
subdivision, and development. Additionally, the comprehensive plan serves as a necessary first step 
and guideline for land use planning and capital improvement planning. 
 
In March 2024, the Rolla City Council selected H3 Studio to prepare an updated comprehensive plan. 
H3 Studio conducted the planning process through 2024 and 2025. Community engagement was 
extensive and included: 

• Formation of a steering committee representing a broad cross-section of the community  
• Business owner roundtables  
• Meetings with downtown stakeholders  
• Surveys of residents and business owners  
• Public workshops and meetings  
• A public open house  
•  

A draft of the plan was presented to the Planning and Zoning Commission and the City Council in 
January 2026, followed by a public open house. Revisions were made based on feedback received 
during these sessions. 
 
On March 10, 2026, the final draft of the Rolla 2050 Comprehensive Plan was presented to the 
Planning and Zoning Commission and formally adopted. The City Council is now being asked to 
consider a resolution of support for the plan. 
 
Attachments: Resolution of support 

Page 100



Resolution No.____________ 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ROLLA, MISSOURI, 
EXPRESSING SUPPORT FOR THE ROLLA 2050 COMPREHENSIVE PLAN 

WHEREAS, RSMo Chapter 89.300 – 89.490 grants third class cities the power to prepare, 
adopt, and amend a comprehensive plan, including plans for sub-areas of a city; and 

WHEREAS, Section 42.110 (Planning and Zoning Commission) of the Rolla City Codes 
authorizes the Planning and Zoning Commission to prepare and adopt a comprehensive plan; and 

WHEREAS, the Rolla 2050 Comprehensive Plan was prepared by H3 Studio with extensive 
input from residents, property owners, business owners, downtown stakeholders, and other 
interested citizens through surveys, a steering committee, public meetings, and a public open 
house; and 

WHEREAS, the Rolla 2050 Comprehensive Plan provides background information, addresses 
land use, infrastructure, and public facility needs, establishes goals, and includes an action plan 
to achieve those goals; and 

WHEREAS, the draft plan was made available on the City website for public review, and public 
notice was provided in the Phelps County Focus; and 

WHEREAS, the Planning and Zoning Commission held a public hearing on March 10, 2026, 
and formally adopted the Rolla 2050 Comprehensive Plan; and 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Rolla, Missouri, 
that the City Council expresses its support for the Rolla 2050 Comprehensive Plan as an 
important guiding document for the City’s future planning, development, and infrastructure 
efforts. 

PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ROLLA, MISSOURI, AND 
APPROVED BY THE MAYOR THIS 6TH DAY OF APRIL 2026. 

         
             
  
          MAYOR 
ATTEST: 
 
 
      
CITY CLERK       APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
                                 ________________________ 

   CITY COUNSELOR   
Page 101



 

  

 

   

 

CITY OF ROLLA 
CITY COUNCIL AGENDA  

DEPARTMENT HEAD:  Dawn Bell, Community Development Director    

ACTION REQUESTED: Ordinance – First Reading                                        

ITEM/SUBJECT:  Adoption of 2024 International Codes 

BUDGET APPROPRIATION: NA                   DATE:  April 6, 2026 

 

Commentary:   

The City of Rolla updated its codes to the 2018 International Codes in early 2019, after nearly 20 years 

without revisions. Due to the significant changes at that time, the Community Development Department 

held workshops with builders, developers, and design professionals to gather input. 

The original 2019 ordinance included language requiring the City to adopt the most current codes every 

other code cycle (a cycle is three years). Accordingly, the 2024 codes are now due for adoption. This 

process ensures the City remains current on code updates, which directly impact life safety. 

Because the 2024 codes contain relatively few significant changes, the Community Development 

Department approached this update differently. Staff collaborated with the National Home Builders 

Association and reviewed ordinances from several Missouri jurisdictions that have already adopted the 

2024 codes. The goal was to identify reasonable amendments based on published research and local 

practices, while maintaining alignment with comparable communities. Once research was complete, 

proposed updates, along with a memo of significant changes from the 2018 to 2024 codes, were shared 

with local contractors, design professionals, and developers for feedback. 

In addition to updating the codes, staff reorganized the material to make it more intuitive and user-

friendly for the public. 

During the fall, an Insurance Service Office (ISO) audit highlighted the need for timely adoption of the 

2024 codes. The audit provided a six-month window to adopt the 2024 codes; failure to do so would 

result in a significant drop in the City’s ISO rating. This rating not only influences local insurance rates 

but also serves as a benchmark for municipal services, similar to an accreditation process. 

State statute requires a 90-day period between adoption and the effective date for building codes so the 

effective date of the Ordinance is August 1, 2026. 

Staff requests a First Reading of the Ordinance.  

Attachments: Ordinance, Exhibits A, B & C, and Memo of substantial changes to I-Codes 

Page 102



AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING THE 2024 INTERNATIONAL CODES AND THE 2023 

NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE; REPEALING AND REPLACING CHAPTER 6 

(BUILDINGS); REPEALING ARTICLES I AND II OF CHAPTER 10 (ELECTRICITY); AND 

RELOCATING SUCH PROVISIONS TO CHAPTER 6; REPEALING CHAPTER 12 

(ENERGY); AND AMENDING CERTAIN SECTIONS OF CHAPTER 14 (FIRE 

PROTECTION) AND CHAPTER 28 (NUISANCES AND PROPERTY MAINTENANCE); 

ALL OF THE CODE OF THE CITY OF ROLLA, MISSOURI. 

WHEREAS, the City of Rolla is committed to protecting the health, safety, and welfare of its 

residents and property; and 

WHEREAS, the International Code Council and the National Fire Protection Association 

periodically update their respective codes to provide uniform standards for construction and 

safety; and 

WHEREAS, adopting the 2024 International Codes and the 2023 National Electrical Code will 

modernize, clarify, and streamline the City’s building and construction regulations; and 

WHEREAS, the International Energy Conservation Code is adopted for advisory purposes to 

encourage energy-efficient and sustainable construction; and 

WHEREAS, the International Property Maintenance Code is periodically updated to provide 

uniform standards for the maintenance, safety, and habitability of residential and commercial 

structures; and 

WHEREAS, the City of Rolla last adopted the 2018 International Codes in 2019, and the 

adoption of the 2024 International Codes ensures that local regulations remain current and 

consistent with modern standards;  

WHEREAS, in order to ensure that Rolla building codes remain up to date, the City of Rolla 

intends to adopt the International Codes every other Code cycle, with the next cycle projected to 

be the 2028 Codes. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED, that the City Council of the City of Rolla adopts 

the provisions set forth in this ordinance. 

Section 1.  That the City Council  hereby adopts the 2024 International Codes and 2023 

National Electrical Code, including local amendments, to protect the public health, safety, 

welfare, and well-being of the City of Rolla, Missouri. 

Section 2. Chapter 6, Buildings, of the Rolla Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its 

entirety and replaced with a new Chapter 6, as set forth in Exhibit A attached hereto and 

incorporated herein by reference. 

Page 103



Section 3. Articles I and II of Chapter 10, Electricity, of the Rolla Municipal Code are 

hereby repealed. The provisions formerly contained therein, as amended, are hereby included 

within the Chapter 6, as set forth in Exhibit A. 

Section 4. Chapter 12, Energy, of the Rolla Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its 

entirety. The relevant provisions thereof, as amended, are incorporated into Chapter 6 as set forth 

in Exhibit A. 

Section 5. Sections 14-1 through 14-3 of Chapter 14, Fire Protection, of the Rolla are 

hereby repealed in its entirety and replaced as set forth in Exhibit B attached hereto and 

incorporated herein by reference. 

Section 6. Sections 28-6 and 28-8 of Chapter 28, Nuisances and Property Maintenance 

are hereby amended and Section 28-11 and 28-12 are hereby repealed and replaced as set forth in 

Exhibit C attached hereto. 

Section 7. Chapter 6, Article VII, Vacant Residential Property Registration is hereby 

relocated to Chapter 28 and renumbered as necessary without substantive changes to its 

provisions as set forth in Exhibit C attached hereto. 

Section 8. All ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed. 

Section 9. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this ordinance is held 

invalid or unconstitutional, such determination shall not affect the remaining portions of this 

ordinance. 

Section 10. This ordinance shall take effect and be in full force from and after the date of 

August 1, 2026. 

PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ROLLA, MISSOURI AND APPROVED 

BY THE MAYOR THIS 20TH DAY OF APRIL 2026. 

     APPROVED: 

 

       ______________________________ 

ATTEST:         Mayor 

 

 

______________________________ 

City Clerk 

 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

 

______________________________ 

City Counselor 
Page 104



 

 

Exhibit A 

Article I Building Regulations 
 

Section 6-1. International Building Code - Adopted 

(a) There is hereby adopted by the City, for the purpose of establishing rules and regulations 

applicable to and governing all building and construction in the City, that certain code known 

as the International Building Code, 2024 Edition, and the Appendix Chapters B, C, I and K, 

of which code not less than one (1) copy has been and now is filed in the office of the City 

Clerk.  Said code, along with all standards and referenced documents therein, is hereby 

adopted and incorporated into the Code of the City of Rolla, Missouri, as if set out at length 

herein.  

(b) This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after August 1, 2026. 

Section 6-2. Same - Amendments. 

(a) 101.1, Title.  Amend to insert ‘City of Rolla, Missouri’. 

(b) 101.4., Energy.  Delete. Refer to adoption of Energy Code. 

(c) 103.1, Creation of Agency. Amend to insert ‘Community Development Department’ 

(d) 105.1.1, Annual Permit. Delete 

(e) 105.1.2, Annual Permit records. Delete 

(f) 105.2, Work exempt from permit.  Delete (1),(7), and (13) and amend as follows: 

Building: 

(1) One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses and 

similar uses, provided that the floor area is not greater than two hundred (200) square 

feet. 

(7) Roof covering, siding, painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, countertops, and         

similar finish work. 

(13) Free-standing signs or monuments over 10 feet in height 

(g) 105.5, Expiration. Delete and amend as follows:   

Every permit issued shall be valid for one (1) year after issuance unless work authorized by 

the permit is not commenced within one hundred eighty (180) days after issuance, or if the 

authorized work is suspended or abandoned for a period of one hundred eighty (180) days 

after the time the work is commenced. At that time the permit would become void and re-

application would need to be made. A one-time, one-year extension of a valid permit may be 

obtained at a cost of one-half (1/2) of the original permit fee. 

 

(h) 109.2, Schedule of permit fees. Amend to add as follows: 

 Refer to Article VII. Fees 

(i) 109.4, Work commencing before permit issuance.  Amend to add as follows: 

 Refer to Article VII. Fees 

Page 105



 

 

(j) 109.6, Refunds. Amend to add as follows:  

Refer to Article VII. Fees 

 

(k) 114.4, Violation penalties. Delete and amend as follows:   

Any person who shall violate a provision of this Code or shall fail to comply with any of the 

requirements thereof or who shall erect, construct, alter or repair a building or structure in 

violation of an approved plan or directive of the code official, or of a permit or certificate 

issued under the provisions of this Code, shall be guilty of a Misdemeanor, punishable by a 

fine of not more than five hundred dollars ($500.00), or by imprisonment not exceeding ninety 

(90) days, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due 

notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense. 

(l) 115.4, Failure to Comply.  Delete and amend as follows: 

Any person who shall continue any work in or about the structure after having been served 

with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a 

violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than fifty dollars ($50.00) or 

more than five hundred dollars ($500.00). 

(m) Section 116: Unsafe Structures and Equipment.  Delete.  Refer to Sections 6-5 through 6-9 

for regulations. 

(n) 502.1 Address Identification. Amend to replace the number four (4) with the number six (6). 

(o) 502.2 Add the following section. Specific Numbers. The approved property address shall be 

those numbers that are determined by the City of Rolla, Missouri. 

(p) 502.3.  Add the following section. Applicability. The provisions of this Ordinance shall also 

be applicable to private and non dedicated streets situated within developments that require 

plat approval under the ordinance of the City of Rolla, Missouri. 

(q) 502.4 Add the following section. Minimum distance: In any instance in which a building with 

address identification is situated a distance of one hundred (100) feet or more from the 

roadway, such street number shall be displayed in a like manner as provided herein on a sign 

located not more than five (5) feet from the right-of-way of said roadway. 

(r) 502.5 Add the following section.  Penalties: A violation of the requirements of this section 

502 shall constitute an offense which shall be punishable by a fine not to exceed fifty dollars 

($50.00). Each day such dwelling or structure shall remain in violation of the requirements of 

this Ordinance shall subject the owner thereof to prosecution for a separate offense. 

(s) 903.2.8, Exception.  Amend to add as follows: 

1. An automatic sprinkler system shall not be required for structures governed by the 2024 

International Residential Code (IRC) as adopted by RSMo 67.281. 

(t) 1804.4.1.  Finished Floor Elevation.  Amend to add as follows: 

(1) Standard Requirement (Curb and Gutter Present). 

The finished floor elevation (FFE) of all principal and accessory structures shall be at or 

above the elevation of the adjacent street curb at the property frontage. The required 

elevation shall be measured from the top of curb to the top of finished floor. 

Page 106



 

 

(2) Sloped Lots. 

On sloped lots, the required FFE shall be measured from the highest adjacent curb 

elevation along the property frontage. Where the building site is located above or below 

street grade, the finished floor shall be designed to provide positive drainage away from 

the structure and shall be at or above the controlling curb elevation as determined by the 

Building Official or City Engineer. 

(3) Sites without curb and gutter. 

Where curb and gutter are not present, the required elevation shall be measured from the 

edge of pavement at the centerline of the property frontage. If no pavement exists, the 

measurement shall be taken from the established street grade as determined by the City 

Engineer. In all cases, the finished floor elevation shall be at or above the controlling 

street grade. 

 

(4) Verification. 

Compliance with this section may be required to be verified by a licensed surveyor or 

registered design professional prior to issuance of certificate of occupancy. 

(u) B101.3. Membership of the board.  Delete and amend as follows: 

The board shall consist of five voting members appointed by the Mayor.  Each member shall 

serve for 5 years or until a successor has been appointed.  The board members’ terms shall be 

at staggered intervals, so as to provide continuity.  The Community Development Director 

shall be an ex officio member of said board but shall not vote on any matter before the board. 

1.  Members shall be residents of the city of Rolla, except that non-residents currently 

serving on the board shall be allowed to continue to serve in that capacity. 

 

Section 6-3. International Residential Code - Adopted.  

(a) There is hereby adopted by the City, for the purpose of establishing rules and regulations 

applicable to and governing all building and construction in the City, that certain code known 

as the International Residential Code, 2024 Edition, and the Appendix Chapters AA, BB, BC, 

BD, BF, BG, BH, CD, CE, and CF, inclusive of amendments adopted with this chapter, of which 

code not less than one (1) copy has been and now are filed in the office of the City Clerk. Said 

code, along with all standards and referenced documents therein, is hereby adopted and 

incorporated into the Code of the City of Rolla, Missouri, as if set out at length herein.  

(b) This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after August 1, 2026. 

Section 6-4. Same - Amendments.  

(a) R101.1, Title, amend by inserting the words "City of Rolla, Missouri". 

(b) R103.1, Creation of Agency, amend by inserting the words “Community Development 

Department” 

(c) R105.2, Work exempt from permit. Amend as follows: 

Building:   

6. Delete and replace with: 

Roof covering, siding, painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, countertops, 

and similar finish work. 

Page 107



 

 

(d) R105.5, Expiration. Delete and amend as follows: 

Every permit issued, shall be valid for one (1) year after issuance unless work authorized 

by the permit has not commenced within one hundred eighty (180) days after its 

issuance, or if the authorized work is suspended or abandoned for a period of one 

hundred eighty (180) days after the time the work is commenced. At that time the permit 

would become void and re-application would need to be made. A one-time, one-year 

extension of a valid permit may be obtained at a cost of one-half (1/2) of the original 

permit fee. 

(e) R106.1.1, At the end of the section, amend by adding the following: 

1. The following shall be provided in addition to other pertinent information for 

construction: 

UL listing for the 2-hour fire rated wall shall be provided for townhouse 

construction. 

(f) R108.2, Schedule of Permit Fees. Amend to add as follows:   

Refer to Article VII.  Fees. 

(g) R108.5, Refunds.  Amend to add as follows: 

Refer to article VII.  Fees. 

(h) 108.6 Work Commencing before permit issuance.  Amend to add as follows: 

 Refer to Article VII. Fees 

1. R110.3 Temporary Occupancy.  Amend to add as follows: 

The applicant shall provide a detailed list of outstanding items and schedule of 

completion when requesting the temporary occupancy. 

(i) R113.1 Membership of board.  Delete and Refer to Section 6-2 (w) of this Chapter. 

(j) R113.4, Violation penalties. Delete and amend as follows: 

Any person who shall violate a provision of this Code or shall fail to comply with any of 

the requirements thereof or who shall erect, construct, alter or repair a building or 

structure in violation of an approved plan or directive of the code official, or of a permit 

or certificate issued under the provisions of this Code, shall be guilty of a Misdemeanor, 

punishable by a fine of not more than five hundred dollars ($500.00), or by 

imprisonment not exceeding ninety (90) days, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each 

day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate 

offense. 

(k) R114.4, Failure to Comply.  Delete and amend as follows: 

Any person who shall continue any work in or about the structure after having been 

served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to 

remove a violation or unsafe conditions, shall be liable to a fine of not less than fifty 

dollars ($50.00) or more than five hundred dollars ($500.00). 

(l) R202 add. Walking Surface: Any surface other than vegetation that has been altered in a way 

to create a pathway for pedestrian travel. 

Page 108



 

 

(m) R301.2.  Amend by inserting Table 

Table R301.2 Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria  

      

Ground 

Snow Load 

Wind Design 
Seismic 

Design 

Category 
Speed 

(mph) 

Topographic 

Effects 

Special 

Wind 

Region 

Windborne 

debris zone 

20 115 ─ ─ ─ C 

 

Subject to Damage from 

Ice Barrier 

underlayment 

required 

Flood 

Hazards 

Air 

Freezing 

Index 

Mean 

Annual 

Temp Weathering 

Frost 

line 

depth 

termite 

Severe 24" Moderate Yes Ord. 2517 750 56° F 

 

(n) R302.5.1, amend to add as follows: 

Exception: Where a CO detector is provided at least 5’ from and not more than 10’ from the 

door, a self-closing device is not required. 

(o) R305.2, Chemical Termiticide Treatment.  At the end of the section add the following: 

When chemical protection against termites is used a certificate or proof of treatment 

from a licensed exterminator will be required. 

(p) R309 Automatic Sprinkler Systems.  Delete 

(q) 317.5: Fire Sprinklers. Delete 

(r) R308.2 Add the following section. Specific Numbers. The approved property address shall 

be those numbers that are determined by the City of Rolla, Missouri. 

(s) R308.3.  Add the following section. Applicability. The provisions of this Ordinance shall also 

be applicable to private and non dedicated streets situated within developments that require 

plat approval under the ordinance of the City of Rolla, Missouri. 

(t) R308.4 Add the following section. Minimum distance: In any instance in which a building 

with address identification is situated a distance of one hundred (100) feet or more from the 

roadway, such street number shall be displayed in a like manner as provided herein on a sign 

located not more than five (5) feet from the right-of-way of said roadway. 

 

(u) R308.5 Add the following section.  Penalties: A violation of the requirements of this section 

308 shall constitute an offense which shall be punishable by a fine not to exceed fifty dollars 

($50.00). Each day such dwelling or structure shall remain in violation of the requirements of 

this Ordinance shall subject the owner thereof to prosecution for a separate offense. 

(v) R318.7, Stairways, Exception one (1) shall be deleted. 

(w) Figure 327.1 amend as follows: Water Closet.  All water closets shall be spaced at least fifteen 

(15) inches from the centerline of the fixture to any wall or plumbing fixture, except the 

centerline of the water closet may be spaced twelve (12) inches if located next to a 

Page 109



 

 

bathtub/shower. 

(x) R401.3.1 Enclosure of Surface Water Runoff.  Amend entire section to add as follows: 

Surface water runoff concentrated into an enclosed pipe system shall not be discharged 

closer than five (5) feet from a property line without prior approval of the Building Official. 

 Exception: Where the water is diverted to an approved swale. 

(y) R403.1.7.3 Finished Floor Elevation Requirement.  Amend to add as follows: 

1. Standard Requirement (Curb and Gutter Present). 

The finished floor elevation (FFE) of all principal and accessory structures shall be at or 

above the elevation of the adjacent street curb at the property frontage. The required 

elevation shall be measured from the top of curb to the top of finished floor. 

2. Sloped Lots. 

On sloped lots, the required FFE shall be measured from the highest adjacent curb 

elevation along the property frontage. Where the building site is located above or below 

street grade, the finished floor shall be designed to provide positive drainage away from 

the structure and shall be at or above the controlling curb elevation as determined by the 

Building Official or City Engineer. 

3. Sites without curb and gutter. 

Where curb and gutter are not present, the required elevation shall be measured from the 

edge of pavement at the centerline of the property frontage. If no pavement exists, the 

measurement shall be taken from the established street grade as determined by the City 

Engineer. In all cases, the finished floor elevation shall be at or above the controlling 

street grade. 

 

4. Verification. 

Compliance with this section may be required to be verified by a licensed surveyor or 

registered design professional prior to issuance of certificate of occupancy. 

(z) R502.3.1, Sleeping Areas and Attic Joist. Delete. 

(aa) R802.11.1.3 Uplift Connection strap. Amend entire section to add as follows:  

Where energy bands are used and the sheathing does not extend to the nailer above the 

energy band, an uplift connection strap shall be placed every four (4) feet. 

(bb) Chapter 11. Delete.  Refer to Article II- Energy Code  

(cc) R2419.4. Sediment trap. Amend to replace ‘any length’ with ‘3 ½ minimum length’ in second 

sentence. 

(dd) R2433.1, Log lighters. Delete and replace with "Not permitted." 

(ee) R2603.5.1, Sewer Depth.  Amend to insert the following: 12”, 12” 

(ff) R2705.1, General, 5. Water closets, lavatories and bidets.  Delete and amend as follows: 

All water closets shall be spaced at least fifteen (15) inches from the centerline of the fixture to 

any wall or plumbing fixture, except the centerline of the water closet may be spaced twelve 

(12) inches if located next to a bathtub/shower.  There shall be a clearance of not less than 21 

inches in front of water closet, lavatory or bidet to any wall, fixture or door. 

 

Page 110



 

 

(gg) P2805, Add.  Water heater sizing. 

Water Heaters shall be sized in accordance with Table 2805 or the manufacturer’s 

recommendations.  The water heater must at a minimum meet the First Hour Rating (FHR) 

requirements of Table 2805. 
 

Table 2805 

Minimum First Hour Rating for Residential Water Heaters 1,2,3 

Number of Bathrooms 
1 to 1.5 2 to 2.5 3 to 3.5 

Number of Bedrooms 
1 2 3 2 3 4 3 4 5 6 

First Hour Rating, in 

Gallons 
38 49 49 49 62 62 62 74 74 74 

                      

FHR = First Hour Rating, 1 gal=3.7854 L, 1 gph=1.5 mL/s 

     1. Tankless Water Heaters shall be sized and installed per manufacturer's  

                 recommendations 

            2. Water Heaters for single family dwellings having more than six bedrooms 

       and/or 3 ½ baths shall be sized per manufacturer's recommendations 

       3.  Table 2805 reflects the total minimum requirements for one or multiple  

               water heating units 
 

(hh) P2903.5 Water hammer.  Amend to add as follows: 

Exception: A water-hammer arrestor is not required in water distribution systems using PEX 

piping or systems using a combination of PEX and copper. 

(ii) P2906.9.1.3 CPVC/AL/CPVC pipe. Amend first sentence as follows: Joint surfaces shall be 

clean and free of moisture, and purple primer shall be applied. 

(jj) P3003.9.2 Solvent cementing.  Delete exceptions. 

(kk) P3102.1, Required Vent Extension. Delete and replace with: 

Every building shall have a main vent a minimum of three (3) inches in diameter that is 

either a vent stack or stack vent. Such vent shall run undiminished in size and as directly as 

possible from the building drain through to the open air above the roof. All other vent 

extensions to the outside shall be not less than two (2) inches in diameter. 

(ll) P3103.1, Roof extensions. Delete and replace with. 

All open vent pipes which extend through a roof shall be terminated at least twelve (12) inches 

above the upslope side of the penetration, except that where a roof is to be used for any 

purpose other than weather protection, the vent extension shall be run at least seven (7) feet 

above the roof. 

 

 
Page 111



 

 

(mm) P3113.1 Size of vents.  Amend to add sentence to paragraph: At least one (1) vent shall    

be three (3) inch unreduced in size extending from the main building drain through the roof. 

(nn)     P3114.3, Where permitted. At the end of the section, amend to add as follows: 

Air admittance valves shall only be allowed in remodel or modification of the existing 

plumbing system when the vent cannot connect into the existing vent system or terminate 

to the outside. 

(oo) E3902.21, D e l e t e  a n d  Replace With. All branch circuits that supply 125-volt,    

single-phase, 15- and 20-ampere receptacle outlets installed in dwelling unit bedrooms 

shall be protected by an arc-fault circuit interrupter(s).  

Section 6-5.  Unsafe buildings: Purpose; Definitions.  

Sections 6-5 through 6-14 shall be known as the "Unsafe Buildings Code". Sections 6-5 

through 6-14 establish necessary procedures to (a) prosecute the owner, occupant, resident, 

or other person in possession, charge or control of improperly maintained or otherwise unsafe 

buildings within the City for failing to properly maintain or otherwise abate and/or remove 

such conditions, (b) provide procedures allowing the City to abate or remove unsafe 

conditions resulting from improperly maintained or kept buildings and structures as they are 

found to exist within the City, (c) allow the City to charge the costs of City implemented 

abatement or removal action to the owners of the property upon which the improperly 

maintained or otherwise unsafe buildings exist and to impose a lien against the property upon 

which the condition are abated or removed, and (d) provide for procedures for permanent 

removal of such unsafe conditions. This Code is an exercise of the City's general police 

power and shall be liberally construed. The following definitions shall apply to the terms 

used herein:  

BUILDING  

Shall mean any house, building, garage, structure or other erected improvement permanently 

affixed to property within the City regardless of whether used for residential or commercial 

purposes.  

CITY  

Shall mean the City of Rolla, Missouri.  

CODE  

As used herein shall mean the Unsafe Building Code.  

 

ADMINISTRATOR  

As used herein shall mean the City's Community Development Director or any qualified 

designee.  

 

HEARING BOARD  

Shall mean the City's then appointed and serving board of adjustment sitting under this Code, 

however, as an administrative hearing panel whose decisions shall be subject to review under 

the Missouri Administrative Procedure and Review Act, Chapter 536, RSMo.  

 

 

 

 

Page 112



 

 

OWNER  

Shall mean any person or entity then shown as the legal owner of the property hereby 

affected as reflected in the records of the Phelps County Recorder of Deeds. It shall not 

include any mortgagee or any beneficiary or trustee under a recorded deed of trust or any 

person with a leasehold interest in the Property under either a written or oral lease, whether 

recorded or unrecorded.  

OCCUPANT  

Means any person or entity in possession of and occupying a building hereby affected for 

purpose, whether as an owner, resident, lessee or licensee under any lease, license or other 

permit.  

UNSAFE BUILDING  

 

As used in the Code shall mean any building hereby affected having those specific qualities 

or conditions discussed and described in Section 6-8 hereof.  

UNSAFE BUILDING CONDITION  

Shall be a building having any of the qualities or conditions described in Section 6-xx hereof.  

PERSON  

Shall mean both the owner and/or any occupant of the property hereby affected.  

PROPERTY  

Shall mean real estate situated within the City upon which an unsafe building is located.  

 

Section 6-6. Unsafe Buildings Prohibited; Constitute Nuisances. 

No owner or occupant of any property within the City shall keep, maintain, cause or permit 

any of the conditions declared to constitute or create as unsafe building under this Code to 

exist upon such property. It shall be the duty of every owner and occupant of any building 

within the City to maintain the same so as not to permit the creation, maintenance or 

existence of an unsafe building condition as defined hereunder. Any building in the City 

determined to be an unsafe building is hereby declared a nuisance.  

Section 6-7. Penalties and Enforcement; Remedies Cumulative.  

 

Any person who/which violates any provision of this Code shall be subject to the following 

penalties, and the City may pursue any or all of the following remedies, which shall be 

deemed to be cumulative and not mutually exclusive.  

(a) Prosecution. The owner, occupant, resident, or other person in possession, charge or control 

of any condition defined hereunder as a nuisance who shall fail to comply with any notice 

or order to repair, vacate or demolish such building issued hereunder shall be deemed to 

have violated this Code and shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not 

more than one thousand dollars ($1,000.00), unless the owner of the property is not also a 

resident of the property, in which case such fine may not exceed two thousand dollars 

($2,000.00), or by imprisonment not exceeding ninety (90) days; or both such fine and 

imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be 

deemed a separate offense. The City through its City Prosecutor may prosecute an alleged 

violation of any provision or requirement of this Code as hereinafter provided. It shall be a 

separate offense for each day the nuisance is allowed or continues to exist.  

Page 113



 

 

(b) Abatement or Removal. Upon determination that an unsafe building exists, the City may 

abate or remove the unsafe building condition and assess the costs thereof in accordance 

with the provisions of this Code.  

(c) Injunction. In order to eliminate, remove or prevent an unsafe building condition which is in 

violation of this Code, the City Counselor, or other attorney(s) employed by the City for 

such specific purpose, may obtain such civil redress as may be appropriate under the 

circumstances, including restraining orders and injunctive relief in a court of competent 

jurisdiction.  

Section 6-8. Unsafe Building Conditions Described.  

Any building upon any property within the City which has any of the following defects or 

conditions shall be deemed an "unsafe building" to the extent that the life, property, or safety 

of the public or occupants of the building are endangered, and shall be declared an unsafe 

building hereunder:  

(a) Those buildings which have exterior or interior walls or other vertical structural 

members that list, lean or buckle to such an extent that a plumb line passing through the 

center of gravity of any such wall or vertical structure members fall outside of the 

middle third of its base.  

(b) Those buildings which, exclusive of the foundation, (i) show any evidence of damage 

or deterioration to the supporting member or members, or (ii) any evidence of damage 

or deterioration of the non-supporting enclosing or outside walls or coverings that 

prevent the building from being secured against unauthorized entrance. 

(c) Whenever any portion or member or appurtenance thereof is likely to fail, or to 

become detached or dislodged or to collapse and thereby posing a risk of injury to 

persons or damage to other property. 

(d) Whenever any portion thereof has wracked, cracked, warped, buckled or settled to 

such an extent that walls or other structural portions have materially less resistance to 

winds or earthquake than is required in the case of similar new construction. 

(e) Those buildings, or any portion thereof, which because of (i) dilapidation, 

deterioration or decay, (ii) faulty construction, (iii) the removal, movement or 

instability of any portion of the ground necessary for the purpose of supporting such 

building, or (iv) the deterioration, decay or inadequacy of its foundation is reasonably 

likely in the opinion of the Administrator to partially or completely collapse. 

(f) Those buildings, as determined by any official law enforcement agency, used for the 

illegal manufacture or storage of a controlled substance as defined by this Article. 

(g) Those buildings under construction, or a fire damaged building upon which no current 

building permit is held and no substantial work shall have been performed for the 

immediately preceding thirty (30) days, and in the opinion of the Administrator 

conditions or defects exist to the extent that the life, property or safety of the public 

or its occupants are endangered. 

(h) Those portions of any building which remains on a site after the demolition or 

destruction of the building unless the portion remaining constitutes the proper and 

secure storage of salvage materials to be removed within thirty (30) days of the 

original demolition or destruction. 

Page 114



 

 

(i) Those buildings used or intended to be used for residential dwelling purposes which 

are, because of inadequate maintenance, dilapidation, decay, damage, faulty 

construction or arrangement, inadequate light, air or sanitation facilities, as reasonably 

determined by the Administrator, unsanitary, unfit for human habitation or in such a 

condition as is likely to cause sickness, disease or injury. 

(j) Those buildings which because of obsolescence, dilapidated condition, deterioration, 

damage, inadequate exits, lack of sufficient fire-resistive construction, faulty electric 

wiring, gas connections or heating apparatus, or other cause are reasonably 

determined by the Administrator to be a fire hazard. 

(k) Those buildings where any door, aisle, passageway, stairway or other means of exit is 

not of sufficient width or size or is not so arranged as to provide safe and adequate 

means of exit in case of fire or panic. 

(l) Those buildings where the walking surface of any aisle, passageway, stairway or other 

means of exit is so warped, worn, loose, torn or otherwise unsafe as to not provide safe 

and adequate means of exit in case of fire or panic. 

(m) Those portions of a building or any member, appurtenance or ornamentation on the 

exterior thereof, which in the reasonable opinion of the Administrator are not of 

sufficient strength or stability, or are not so anchored, attached or fastened in place so 

as to be capable of resisting wind pressure of one-half (1/2) of that specified in the 

building code for new buildings of similar structure, purpose or location without 

exceeding the working stresses permitted in the building code for such buildings. 

(n) Those buildings which are abandoned for a period in excess of six (6) months so as to 

constitute such building or portion thereof as an attractive nuisance or hazard to the 

public, in which the electrical, plumbing, mechanical, or other systems are totally or 

partially damaged, destroyed, removed or otherwise made inoperable, unsafe or 

unsanitary, or such conditions or defects exist to the extent that the life, property or 

safety of the public or its occupants are endangered. 

Section 6-9. Enforcement Administration.  

The following provisions set forth the procedures for notice, administrative hearings 

and enforcement of the Unsafe Buildings Code: 

(a) Complaints. The Administrator shall receive any complaint regarding an alleged unsafe 

building condition hereunder and, based upon such a complaint or said Administrator's 

own observations, inspect and make initial determinations of the existence of an unsafe 

building condition and issue a notice to abate or remove the unsafe building condition, 

and /or require that the building be vacated until the unsafe building condition has been 

remedied, all as hereafter provided. 

(b) Inspections; Right of Entry upon Property for Inspections. The Administrator shall be 

permitted to enter upon private property for the purpose of making such inspection if 

necessary to conduct said inspection but only upon the express written consent of the 

owner of said property or under the specific authority granted pursuant to a lawful 

warrant issued by a court of competent jurisdiction as provided herein. 

 Page 115



 

 

(c) Requirement of Abatement Notice. Notice of the existence of an unsafe building 

condition shall be required in order to require abatement of the condition described 

hereunder or for the prosecution of a violation or the finding of a violation of any 

provision of the Unsafe Buildings Code in the Municipal Court of the City of Rolla. 

Notice shall not be required, and shall not be a prerequisite, to an action for injunctive 

relief hereunder. 

(d) Standards for Abatement. The following standards shall determine whether a building 

shall be ordered to be repaired, vacated or demolished under the terms of this Code: 

(1) If the unsafe building can be reasonably repaired so that it does not constitute a 

unsafe building, as herein defined, it may be ordered repaired. 

(2) If the unsafe building is in such condition as to make it dangerous to the health, 

safety or general welfare of human occupants, but it is reasonably capable of being 

repaired so that it will not constitute a dangerous building, it shall be ordered to be 

vacated until repaired and ordered repaired. 

(3) If the unsafe building cannot be reasonably repaired so that it will not constitute 

an unsafe building as herein defined, it shall be ordered to be demolished. 

(e) When Abatement Notice Given; to Whom. When the Administrator has made an initial 

determination of the existence of an unsafe building condition as defined hereunder, 

he/she shall as soon as possible thereafter notify the owner, occupant, lessee, mortgagee 

and any other person or entity having a legal or equitable interest in the property as shown 

by the land records of the Phelps County Recorder of Deeds. 

(f) Contents of Abatement Notice. The abatement notice shall state: (1) the specific 

provision(s) of the Unsafe Buildings Code violated; (2) the address and the legal 

description of the property where the condition exists; (3) the name of the Administrator 

and the address and telephone number of his/her office; (4) the actions necessary to 

remove or abate the unsafe condition, the time within which abatement must occur or 

commence, which shall not be fewer than twenty (20) days from the date of service of the 

notice if notice is made personally or by certified mail, or not fewer than forty-five (45) 

days of first publication if notice is made by publication; (5) whether the property must 

be vacated during repairs or, if demolition is required, that the property must be 

immediately vacated; and (6) that the City may request a hearing before the Hearing 

Board requesting authority to abate or remove the unsafe building condition upon not 

less than twenty (20) days notice if corrective action to abate or remove the unsafe 

condition is not otherwise undertaken by the owner or occupant, or same other person 

on his/her/its behalf as required. 

(g) City Initiated Abatement; Hearing Required. Upon failure of the owner and/or occupant 

to abate or remove the unsafe building condition upon notice as aforesaid, the City may 

proceed to abate or remove the condition. However, no such abatement or removal action 

shall be commenced by the City until a hearing has been conducted before the Hearing 

Board pursuant to this Code. Upon any such failure of the owner and/or occupant of the 

property to undertake the corrective action as described in the notice to abate or remove 

given as aforesaid, the Administrator may request in writing to the City Clerk a hearing 

before the Hearing Board. Upon receipt of a request for hearing from the Administrator; 

the City Clerk shall request the Hearing Board to issue written notice of the date, time 

and place of the hearing, which shall be not less than twenty (20) days after service of 

such hearing notice if made by personal service or by certified mail, or not less that forty-

Page 116



 

 

five (45) days of first publication if service is made by publication. 

(h) Contents of Hearing Notice. The hearing notice shall state: (1) the specific provision(s) 

of the Unsafe Buildings Code allegedly violated; (2) the address and the legal description 

of the property where the condition exists; (3) the name of the Administrator and the 

address and telephone number of his/her office; (4) the date, time and place of the hearing 

to be held; (5) that the City is seeking an order authorizing it to cause said unsafe building 

condition to be abated or removed at the owner's expense; and (6) that the costs of 

abatement or removal of the unsafe building condition shall be assessed as a special tax 

bill, shall be deemed a personal debt against the property owner and, in addition, shall be 

a lien on the property until paid. 

(i) Service of Notice. Notice of the Administrator's request for abatement or removal of an 

unsafe building condition under this Code, and notice of any hearing requested by the 

Administrator before the Hearing Board, shall be served as follows: 

(1) Upon Who Served. Service shall be upon each and every owner, occupant, lessee, 

mortgagee and any other person or entity having a legal or equitable interest in the 

property as shown by the land records of the Phelps County Recorder of Deeds. 

(2) How Served; Posting; Personal Delivery or Certified Mail. Service of any notice 

required under this code in all cases shall be made by posting any notice required 

hereunder upon the affected property in a conspicuous place. Service of any 

required notice shall also be attempted by either personally delivering the written 

notice to the person to be served, or by delivering said notice by certified mail, 

return receipt requested, to the person to be served. If service is had by personal 

delivery, the same shall be attested to by the person making service, to include the 

name and signature of the person making service, the name of the person served, 

the date, time and location of service, and a description of the notice so served. If 

service is by certified mail, the City Clerk shall be responsible for keeping the 

signed return receipt and the same shall constitute proof of service by certified mail. 

(3) Service Cannot be had by Personal Delivery or Certified Mail. If service by 

personal delivery or by certified mail as described above is not possible, the person 

responsible for making service shall attest in writing to the lack of personal service 

or service by certified mail. Said writing shall include the name and signature of 

the person attempting service, the name of the person to have been served, a 

description of the reasonable attempts to obtain service by personal delivery or 

certified mail, including a description of the date and nature of the attempts at 

service. Said writing shall be retained by the City Clerk along with any other 

documents associated with the unsuccessful service attempts. 

(4) Service by Publication; When. If service of any notice required hereunder cannot 

be made as aforesaid, service shall be made by publication. The publication shall 

contain the full test of the hearing notice, as required by this Code, and shall be 

published at least once each week for four (4) consecutive weeks on the same day 

of the week in a newspaper of general circulation published in Phelps County, 

Missouri. The time, date, and place of the specified in the notice of hearing to be 

held, or for the commencement of abatement or removal work or for any other thing 

to be done, shall be at least forty-five (45) days from the date of the first publication 

of notice. The person causing the service of the notice by publication shall be 

responsible for obtaining from the publisher an affidavit of publication, which shall 

Page 117



 

 

be retained by the City Clerk and which shall constitute proof of service by 

publication. 

(j) Conduct of Hearing. At the hearing before the Hearing Board, any party may be 

represented by counsel, and all parties shall have an opportunity to be heard and present 

such evidence as shall be relevant to a determination of whether or not an unsafe building 

condition exists under the terms of the Unsafe Buildings Code. An official court reporter 

shall make a written record of the hearing. All testimony shall be under oath, which may 

be administered by the City Clerk or by the court reporter making a written record of the 

hearing. The cost of the court reporter shall be paid by the City should the proceeding 

be eventually held against the City, and by the owner if it should not. In the latter case, 

the cost of such reporting shall be added to the cost of abatement or removal of the unsafe 

building condition as undertaken by the City, and shall be added to the costs of the 

abatement or removal in the event the City  

(k) Findings of Hearing Board; Vote. Within twenty (20) days from the date of the hearing 

required hereunder, the Hearing Board shall upon the basis of competent and substantial 

evidence offered at the hearing make written findings of fact as to whether or not the 

property in question has upon it an unsafe building condition under the terms of the 

Unsafe Buildings Code. Specifically, if it is found that an unsafe building condition 

exists, the written findings shall state the condition or conditions which constitute the 

unsafe building. The concurring vote of three (3) members of the Hearing Board shall 

be necessary to find that an unsafe building condition exists. The Hearing Board may 

make such further orders as just and necessary to cause abatement or removal of the 

unsafe building condition found to exist. If the Hearing Board finds that an unsafe 

building condition does not exist, the proceeding shall be dismissed. 

(l) The City Finance Director shall establish procedures wherein twenty-five percent (25%) 

of the proceeds payable under any insurance policy resulting from a casualty loss to any 

building upon property within the City, where the loss exceeds fifty percent (50%) of the 

face value of the policy covering the building, is withheld. The insurer shall, upon the 

written request of the City, pay said twenty-five percent (25%) of the proceeds to the 

City which shall be deposited in an interest bearing account. The City shall release the 

proceeds and any interest which has accrued on such proceeds received hereunder to the 

insured or as the terms of the policy and endorsements thereto provide within thirty (30) 

days after receipt of such insurance moneys, unless the City has enforcement 

proceedings under the provisions of subparagraph (f) of this Section. If the City has 

hereunder proceeded with abatement or removal proceedings, all moneys in excess of 

that necessary to comply with the provisions this Code for City initiated abatement or 

removal of unsafe building conditions, less salvage value, shall be paid to the insured. If 

there are no proceeds of any insurance policy as set forth in this subparagraph, at the 

request of the taxpayer, the tax bill described herein may be paid in installments over a 

period of not more than ten (10) years. This subparagraph shall apply to fire, explosion, 

or other casualty loss claims arising on all buildings. This subparagraph does not make 

the city a party to any insurance contract, and the insurer is not liable to any party for 

any amount in excess of the proceeds otherwise payable under its insurance policy. 

Section 6-10.  Abatement Administration upon Hearing 

The following provisions set forth the procedures for abatement or removal of violations of the 

Unsafe Buildings Code upon hearing held as aforesaid: 
Page 118



 

 

(a) Abatement. If an unsafe building condition is found to exist upon the required hearing, 

the Administrator shall proceed to cause the condition which constitutes a violation 

hereunder to be abated or removed in compliance with any orders made by the Hearing 

Board; provided that if the estimated cost of the abatement or removal exceeds one 

thousand dollars ($1,000.00), the Administrator shall not proceed until he/she has 

obtained the consent of the City Council to incur the cost of abatement or removal. If 

presented to the City Council, it may direct the Administrator to pursue alternative relief, 

such as prosecution or injunctive relief, to cause abatement of the nuisance, any orders 

issued by the Hearing Board to the contrary notwithstanding. The City shall not enter 

upon the property to commence abatement activities except upon the express written 

consent of the owner of said property or under the specific authority granted pursuant 

to a lawful warrant issued by a court of competent jurisdiction as provided herein. 

(b) Emergency measures. In cases where it reasonably appears that there is an immediate 

danger to the health, safety or welfare of any person, the Administrator may take 

emergency measures to vacate, repair, board up or demolish an unsafe building, provided 

that written notice shall be given to the owner, occupant, lessee, mortgagee, agent and 

all other persons having an interest in such building or structure as promptly as possible, 

even if only after the emergency measures are taken. The cost of any such emergency 

work shall be collected in the same manner as herein provided. Unless serious bodily 

injury or death is likely to occur without emergency action, the City shall not enter upon 

the property to commence emergency measures except upon the express written consent 

of the owner of said property or under the specific authority granted pursuant to a lawful 

warrant issued by a court of competent jurisdiction as provided herein. 

(c) Securing Buildings. In all cases where a building does not meet the standards for unsafe 

buildings as set forth in section 6-28, but which constitutes a nuisance to the general 

public because it is vacant and open to unauthorized entry, the Administrator may notify 

the owner to secure the building within twenty-four (24) hours. In the event the owner 

fails to secure the building within that time, the Administrator may take whatever 

measures are necessary to secure the building. The cost of such measures shall be 

recovered in the same manner as herein set forth. 

(d) Standards for Securing Buildings. The following are the standards to be met when a 

building is secured as provided in Section 6-30(c): 

(1) All doors and other openings other than windows shall be securely locked, boarded, 

barricaded or otherwise secured. 

(2) All windows shall be locked or otherwise secured by the installation of security 

screens or grills. No windows shall be secured by covering them with boards or 

planks of wood or similar material, except as may be provided herein. 

(3) In the event that a vacant building should pose a threat to the health, safety or 

welfare of the public, the Administrator shall order the building to be boarded up 

on all sides with the cost of such work to be the responsibility of the owner of the 

building. The building shall be secured by the application of one-half-inch thick 

exterior grade plywood. Such plywood shall be painted with a neutral color to 

match the building. 

(4) In the event a building is damaged by fire, tornado or other such catastrophe, the 

owner of the damaged building may board the windows thereof for a period not to 

Page 119



 

 

exceed six weeks. 

(e) Assessment of Abatement Costs. If the abatement is performed by City employees, the 

cost of the abatement shall be calculated according to the schedule of costs promulgated 

by the Administrator and kept on file in the office of the City Clerk. This schedule is to 

be determined after an analysis by the Administrator and other officers and department 

heads of the City deemed necessary by the Administrator to determine an accurate 

estimation of the costs incurred by the City to abate conditions subject to the provisions 

hereof. If the abatement or removal is performed by independent contractors hired by 

the City, the costs charged for the abatement or removal will be the actual amount paid 

to the contractor for the abatement or removal performed. Any and all direct fees and 

costs, including, but not limited to, landfill fees, hearing costs, and publication fees shall 

be included in the cost hereof. 

(f) Tax Bills for Work; Manner of Payment. Whenever the City shall have caused abatement 

or removal work to be performed as provided hereunder, the Administrator shall certify 

the cost of the work to the City Clerk who shall cause the certified costs to be included 

in a special tax bill to be issued against the property from which the condition was 

removed or added to the annual real estate tax bill for said property, at the City Clerk's 

option. Said certified costs shall be collected by the County Collector or other officials 

designated by the City to collect real property taxes. If the certified costs are not paid, 

the tax bill shall be considered delinquent. The collection of the delinquent bill shall be 

governed by the laws governing delinquent and back taxes. The special tax bill from the 

date of its issuance shall be deemed a personal debt against the owner of the property, 

and in addition shall be a lien on property until paid. Any tax bill hereunder shall bear 

interest at a rate of nine percent (9%) per annum until paid. 

(g) Enforcement of Tax Bills. Tax bills issued under this Code shall be prima facie evidence 

of the validity of the bill, the doing of the work and the liability of the property and 

owner thereof for the charges stated in the bill and may be collected, if default should 

occur, by enforcement of the City's tax lien in accordance with State law, and/or by suit 

brought in a court of competent jurisdiction by the City Counselor or by an attorney 

contracted with for the purpose on behalf of the City. Judgment in any such suit shall be 

satisfied by any means authorized by statutes or rules of court of the State. 

(h) Warrant Application. Any warrant to enter upon property when required hereunder for 

the purpose of inspection of property, emergency measures, or for the purpose of 

initiating abatement activities shall be applied for by written affidavit of the 

Administrator to either the Municipal or Associate Division of the Circuit of Phelps 

County, Missouri. Such affidavit shall set forth (i) the legal description of the property 

for which the warrant is applied, (ii) the name and address of the owner of the property, 

(iii) specific facts constituting probable cause that an unsafe building as defined by this 

Code exists for which entry is required or that the existence of an unsafe building has 

been determined upon full and adequate hearing as herein required, and (iv) that entry 

upon the property is necessary to fully investigate the nature and extent of the unsafe 

conditions, or to take emergency measures, or to abate said unsafe conditions upon order 

of the Hearing Board where the owner of the property has failed to comply with such 

order. 

 

 

Page 120



 

 

Section 6-11.  Appeals Under Administrative Review Act. 

Any owner of property who is adversely affected by a decision of the Hearing Board may 

appeal from the order and findings made under the provisions of this Code. The appeal 

shall be to a Circuit Court of Phelps County, Missouri, as required under Chapter 536 of 

the Revised Statutes of Missouri. 

Section 6-12.  Duty of Public Officers is to City. 

No officer, agent or employee of the City shall be personally liable for any damage that may 

occur to any persons or property as a result of any act required of him or permitted to be 

taken by him under the terms of this code. It hereby further declared that no officer, agent 

or employee of the City owes any duty under the provisions of this Code to any citizen or 

other individual but that the duties prescribed herein and imposed upon officers, agents or 

employees of the City are duties to be performed for and on behalf of the government of 

said City. 

Section 6-13.  Storage; Redemption; Sale. 

After the determination that an unsafe building condition exists upon due hearing as herein 

required, items having any apparent monetary value, beyond salvage value, removed 

during any City undertaken abatement or removal shall be transported to a storage area or 

lot at the expense of the owner or person in custody thereof. Such items shall then be stored 

for a period of at least thirty (30) days and the person entitled to possession thereof may 

redeem the items by payment to the City of the actual cost of removal, transportation and 

storage. If any item is unredeemed after the expiration of the thirty-day period, the 

Administrator, or his/her designee, may sell such items to the highest bidder or, if the items 

have no sale value, may otherwise dispose of them. Any money received from the disposal 

of any items shall be applied to the costs charged to the owner or person in charge thereof. 

Section 6-14.  Technical Codes 

After the determination that an unsafe building condition exists upon due hearing as herein 

required, items having any apparent monetary value, beyond salvage value, removed 

during any City undertaken abatement or removal shall be transported to a storage area or 

lot at the expense of the owner or person in custody thereof. Such items shall then be stored 

for a period of at least thirty (30) days and the person entitled to possession thereof may 

redeem the items by payment to the City of the actual cost of removal, transportation and 

storage. If any item is unredeemed after the expiration of the thirty-day period, the 

Administrator, or his/her designee, may sell such items to the highest bidder or, if the items 

have no sale value, may otherwise dispose of them. Any money received from the disposal 

of any items shall be applied to the costs charged to the owner or person in charge thereof. 

Section 6-15.  Moving Buildings – Permit Required 

Any person desiring to move any structure over, along or through the public streets or 

thoroughfares of the city shall obtain a permit from the city engineer to move such 

structure. 

Section 6-16.  Same – Special Permit for certain buildings 

If any structure sought to be moved under Section 6-10 exceeds twenty (20) feet in height 

and twenty-four (24) feet in width, a special permit to move such structure shall be obtained 

from the city engineer and the city engineer shall designate the route to be used in the 

Page 121

https://ecode360.com/42739628#42739628


 

 

moving of the structure, and if, in the opinion of the city engineer, the structure cannot be 

safely moved to its new location without creating traffic hazards or damaging property of 

the city or others, then the city engineer shall refuse to issue such permit. 

Section 6-17 through 6-19. (Reserved) 

Article II  Energy Conservation 

Section 6-20. Energy Conservation Code - Adopted. 

(a) This section shall be known as the City’s Energy Conservation Code and can be cited as 

such. 

(b) The 2024 International Energy Conservation Code (IECC), as published by the 

International Code Council shall be used as an advisory Energy Conservation Code only, 

and are not mandatory, of which one (1) copy has been and is now filed in the office of 

the city clerk. 

(c) This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after August 1, 2026. 

Section 6-21.  Same - Scope. 

This section sets forth energy efficiency related requirements for the design and construction of 

buildings regulated by this chapter.  

Exception: Portions of the building thermal envelope that do not enclose conditioned space.  

 

(a) Residential Occupancies. 

The minimum required R-value for each element of the building thermal envelope shall be 

in accordance with the following:  

1. Wall assemblies forming portions of a building envelope shall meet or exceed an R factor 

rating of R-13. This requirement does not apply to doors, windows, or other openings or 

approved penetrations nor does it apply to basement concrete walls when the basement is 

not finished as a habitable space.  

2. Floor assemblies forming portions of a building envelope shall meet or exceed an R 

factor rating of 19. Garage ceilings with living area above shall comply with this 

requirement.  

Exception: Concrete floors in contact with the earth need not be insulated.  

3. Roof assemblies forming portions of a building envelope shall meet or exceed an R factor 

rating of 19. This requirement does not apply to skylights or other approved penetrations.  

4. Ceilings forming portions of a building envelope shall meet or exceed an R factor rating 

of thirty (30) at the time of installation.  

5. Duct insulation. All portions of the air distribution system shall be installed in accordance 

with Section M1601 and be insulated to an installed R-5 when system components are 

located within the building but outside of conditioned space, and R-8 when located 

outside of the building. When located within a building envelope assembly, at least R-8 

shall be applied between the duct and that portion of the assembly furthest from 

conditioned space.  

 
Page 122



 

 

(b) Non-residential occupancies. 

The minimum required R-value for each element of the building thermal envelope shall be in 

accordance with the following:  

Exception: The Building Official may approve a decreased R-Value for building exterior 

walls provided the space is normally not occupied by employees and is associated with 

storage/warehouse or manufacturing.  

1. Wall assemblies forming portions of a building envelope shall meet or exceed an R 

factor rating of 11. This requirement does not apply to doors, windows or other 

openings or approved penetrations nor does it apply to unfinished basement concrete 

walls.  

2. Floor assemblies forming portions of a building envelope shall meet or exceed an R 

factor rating of 19.  

Exception: Concrete floors in contact with the earth need not be insulated.  

3. Roof assemblies forming portions of a building envelope shall meet or exceed an R 

factor 19.  

(c)    Materials and Equipment. 

Materials and equipment shall be identified in a manner that will allow a determination of 

their compliance with this chapter. Materials and equipment shall be installed in 

accordance with the manufacturer's installation instructions.  

Insulation. The thermal resistance (R-value) shall be indicated on all insulation and the 

insulation installed such that the R-value can be verified. Where blown-in or sprayed 

insulation is applied the installer shall provide a certification of the installed density and R-

value if requested by the Building Official.  

(d) Definitions. 

For the purpose of this article, certain terms are defined as follows:  

Building envelope: The elements of a building, which enclose conditioned spaces through 

which thermal energy may be transferred to or from the exterior.  

Floor assembly: A floor assembly shall be considered as all components of any floor 

forming a portion of the building envelope through which heat flows, thereby creating a 

building transmission heat loss or gain.  

R-factor: A measure of ability to retard heat flow, R is the numerical reciprocal of U, thus 

R=1/U.R is used in combination with numerals to designate thermal resistance units.  

Roof assembly: A roof assembly shall be considered as all components of the roof or 

ceiling envelope through which heat flows, thereby creating a building transmission heat 

loss or gain, where such assembly is exposed to outdoor air and encloses a heated or 

mechanically cooled space.  

Thermal transmittance (J): Coefficient of heat transmission expressed in units of BTU per 

hour square foot per degree F. The J value applies to combinations of different materials 

used in series along the heat flow path.  
Page 123



 

 

Wall assembly: A wall assembly shall be considered as all components of any wall 

forming a portion of the building envelope through which heat flows, thereby creating a 

building transmission heat loss or gain.  

(e) Enforcement.  

The code adopted by the provisions of this Ordinance shall be enforced by the 

Community Development Director or designee. 

(f) Penalties.  

Any person who shall violate a provision of this Code or shall fail to comply with any 

of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, construct, alter or repair a building or 

structure in violation of an approved plan or directive of the code official, or of a permit 

or certificate issued under the provisions of this Code, shall be guilty of a 

Misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than five hundred dollars ($500.00), or 

by imprisonment not exceeding ninety (90) days, or both such fine and imprisonment. 

Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a 

separate offense. 

 

Section 6-21 through 6-24. (Reserved) 

Article III  Mechanical Code 

Section 6-25. International Mechanical Code – Adopted 

(a) There is hereby adopted by the City, for the purpose of establishing rules and regulations 

applicable to and governing all building and construction in the City, that certain code 

known as the International Mechanical Code, 2024 Edition, and the Appendix Chapter A, 

of which code not less than one (1) copy has been and now is filed in the office of the 

City Clerk. Said code, along with all standards and referenced documents therein, is 

hereby adopted and incorporated into the Code of the City of Rolla, Missouri, as if set out 

at length herein.  

 

(b) This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after August 1, 2026. 

 

Section 6-26. Same – Amendments. 

(a) 101.1 Title. Is hereby amended by inserting the words “City of Rolla, Missouri.” 

(b) 103.1.  Creation of agency.  Insert ‘Community Development Department’ 

(c) 105.1.1. Annual Permit. Delete. 

(d) 105.1.2. Annual Permit Records.  Delete. 

(e) 105.4.1.  Replace the word ‘Approved’ with the word ‘Reviewed’ 

(f) 105.4.3.  Expiration.  Delete and replace with: 

Every permit issued shall be valid for one (1) year after issuance unless work authorized by 

the permit is not commenced within one hundred eighty (180) days after its issuance, or if the 

authorized work is suspended or abandoned for a period of one hundred eighty (180) days 

Page 124



 

 

after the time the work is commenced. At that time the permit would become void and re-

application would need to be made. A one-time, one-year extension of a valid permit may be 

obtained at a cost of one-half (1/2) of the original permit fee. 

(g) 108.2. Schedule of Permit fees.  Add the following language: 

Refer to Article VII.  Fees 

(h) 108.4.  Work commencing before permit issuance.  Add the following language: 

Refer to Article VII. Fees. 

(i) 108.6.  Refunds.  Delete and add Refer to Article VII. Fees. 

(j) 113.1. Membership of board.  Delete and refer to Section 6-2 (w) of this Chapter. 

(k) 114.4. Violation penalties.  Delete and replace with: 

Any person who shall violate a provision of this Code or shall fail to comply with any of the 

requirements thereof or who shall erect, construct, alter or repair a building or structure in 

violation of an approved plan or directive of the code official, or of a permit or certificate 

issued under the provisions of this Code, shall be guilty of a Misdemeanor, punishable by a 

fine of not more than five hundred dollars ($500.00), or by imprisonment not exceeding 

ninety (90) days, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues 

after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense. 

 

(l) 115.4.  Failure to comply.  Delete and replace with: 

Any person who shall continue any work in or about the structure after having been served 

with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a 

violation or unsafe conditions, shall be liable to a fine of not less than fifty dollars ($50.00) 

or more than five hundred dollars ($500.00). 

Section 6-27 through 6-29. (Reserved) 

Article IV Electrical Code 

Section 6-30. National Electrical Code - Adopted  

(a) There is hereby adopted by the City, for the purpose of establishing rules and regulations 

applicable to and governing all building and construction in the City, that certain code 

known as the National Electrical Code, 2023 Edition, and the Appendix Chapter A, of 

which code not less than one (1) copy has been and now is filed in the office of the City 

Clerk.   Said code, along with all standards and referenced documents therein, is hereby 

adopted and incorporated into the Code of the City of Rolla, Missouri, as if set out at 

length herein.  

 

(b) This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after August 1, 2026. 

 

Section 6-31.  Same – Additional Standards and Specifications 

 

(a) Conduits and wiring for bulk oil and service stations. 

Page 125



 

 

All bulk oil and service stations within the city shall be wired in rigid iron conduit and shall 

be wired in conformity with the requirements of the National Electrical Code for hazardous 

locations. 

 

(b) Service Connections. 

All exposed conduits to the Utility Company's supply side of the meter base shall be rigid 

heavy-wall steel. 

 

(c) Ground Wire Required. 

All electrical systems in any structure within the city shall have an independent ground wire 

installed with such electrical system 

 

(d) Minimum wire sizes. 

copper twelve (12) gauge shall be the minimum wire size for branch circuit receptacle outlets. 

Fourteen (14) gauge copper wire shall be allowed for residential fifteen amp lighting circuits. 

 

Section 6-32 Same – In General 

(a) Right of entry to inspect. 

The Community Development Director, or designee, shall have the right during reasonable 

hours to enter any building in the discharge of their official duties, or for the purpose of making 

any inspection or test or the installation of electrical wiring, electrical devices or electrical 

material, and shall have the authority to cause the turning off of all electrical current and cut 

or disconnect, in cases of emergency, any wires where such electrical current is dangerous to 

life or property or may interfere with work of the fire department. 

 

(b) Procedure for correcting defective installations. 

When the installation of any wiring, devices and materials is found, during an inspection to 

be in a dangerous or unsafe condition, the person using or operating the same shall be 

notified and shall make the necessary repairs or changes required to place such wiring, 

devices and materials in safe condition and have such work completed within fifteen (15) 

days or any longer period specified by the inspector in the notice. The inspector is hereby 

empowered to order the discontinue of electrical service to any building or site in which 

electrical wiring devices or material is found to be in a dangerous or unsafe condition by 

issuing a written order of disconnect to the utility company serving the building or site. 

Service may be restored after the electrical inspector issues a written permit to the utility 

company authorizing reconnection of the electric service. 

 

(c) Permit – Required. 

 

An electrical permit shall be required for all new electrical services, and for alterations, 

additions or repair to existing electrical services, including the wiring of buildings for the 

placing of any electric lights, motors, heating devices or any apparatus requiring the use of an 

electrical current. 

 

Exception: No permit shall be required for minor repair work, such as repairing flush and 

snap switches, replacing fuses, changing lamp sockets and receptacles, and repairing drop 

cords. 

 

(d) Fees.  Refer to Article VI. Fees. 

Page 126



 

 

 

Section 6-33 through 6-34. (Reserved) 

 

Article V Plumbing Code 

Section 6-35. International Plumbing Code – Adopted 

(a) There is hereby adopted by the City, for the purpose of establishing rules and regulations 

applicable to and governing all building and construction in the City, that certain code 

known as the International Plumbing Code, 2024 Edition, and the Appendix Chapter B, 

C, D, and E of which code not less than one (1) copy has been and now is filed in the 

office of the City Clerk.  Said code, along with all standards and referenced documents 

therein, is hereby adopted and incorporated into the Code of the City of Rolla, Missouri, 

as if set out at length herein.  

 

(b) This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after August 1, 2026. 

 

Section 6-36. Same – Amendments. 

(a) 101.1 Title. Is hereby amended by inserting the words “City of Rolla, Missouri.” 

(b) 103.1.  Creation of agency.  Insert ‘Community Development Department’ 

(c) 105.1.1. Annual Permit. Delete. 

(d) 105.1.2. Annual Permit Records.  Delete. 

(e) 105.5.1. Approved Construction Documents.  Replace the word ‘Approved’ with the word 

‘Reviewed’ 

(f) 105.5.3.  Expiration.  Delete and replace with: 

Every permit issued shall be valid for one (1) year after issuance unless work authorized by 

the permit is not commenced within one hundred eighty (180) days after its issuance, or if the 

authorized work is suspended or abandoned for a period of one hundred eighty (180) days 

after the time the work is commenced. At that time the permit would become void and re-

application would need to be made. A one-time, one-year extension of a valid permit may be 

obtained at a cost of one-half (1/2) of the original permit fee. 

 

(g) 108.2.  Schedule of Permit Fees.  Add the following language: 

Refer to Article VII.  Fees. 

(h) 108.4.  Work commencing before permit issuance.  Add the following language: 

Refer to Article VII. Fees. 

(i) 108.6.  Refunds.  Delete and add Refer to Article VII. Fees 

(j) 113.1. Membership of board.  Delete and refer to Section 6-2 (w) of this Chapter. 

Page 127



 

 

(k) 114.4. Violation penalties.  Delete and replace with: 

Any person who shall violate a provision of this Code or shall fail to comply with any of the 

requirements thereof or who shall erect, construct, alter or repair a building or structure in 

violation of an approved plan or directive of the code official, or of a permit or certificate 

issued under the provisions of this Code, shall be guilty of a Misdemeanor, punishable by a 

fine of not more than five hundred dollars ($500.00), or by imprisonment not exceeding 

ninety (90) days, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues 

after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense. 

 

(l) 115.4.  Failure to comply.  Delete and replace with: 

Any person who shall continue any work in or about the structure after having been served 

with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a 

violation or unsafe conditions, shall be liable to a fine of not less than fifty dollars ($50.00) 

or more than five hundred dollars ($500.00). 

Section 6-37. Cross-connection control. 

(a) Cross-connection control - general policy. 

(1) Purpose: The purpose of this Ordinance is: 

a. To protect the public potable water supply from contamination or pollution by 

containing within the consumer's internal distribution system or private water system 

contaminants or pollutants which could backflow through the service connection into 

the public potable water supply system. 

b. To promote the elimination, containment, isolation or control of existing cross 

connections, actual or potential, between the public or consumer's potable water system 

and nonpotable water systems, plumbing fixtures, and industrial process systems. 

c. To provide for the maintenance of a continuing program of cross connection control 

which will systematically and effectively prevent the contamination or pollution of all 

potable water systems. 

(2) Application: This Ordinance shall apply to all premises served by the public potable water 

system of the City of Rolla. 

(3) Policy: 

a. This Ordinance will be reasonably interpreted by the water supplier. It is the water 

supplier's intent to recognize the varying degrees of hazard and to apply the principle 

that the degree of protection shall be commensurate with the degree of hazard. 

b. The water supplier shall be primarily responsible for protection of the public potable 

water distribution system from contamination or pollution due to backflow or 

contaminants or pollutants through the water service connection. The cooperation of 

all consumers is required to implement and maintain the program to control cross 

connections. The water supplier and consumer are jointly responsible for preventing 

contamination of the water system. 

c. If, in the judgment of the water supplier or his authorized representative, cross 

connection protection is required through either piping modification or installation of 

Page 128



 

 

an approved backflow prevention device, due notice shall be given to the consumer. 

The consumer shall immediately comply by providing the required protection at his 

own expense; and failure, refusal, or inability on the part of the consumer to provide 

such protection shall constitute grounds for discontinuing water service to the premises 

until such protection has been provided. 

d. If, in the opinion of the water supplier or his authorized representative, a real and 

serious threat to public health is posed, the water supplier may discontinue service 

without notice. 

(b) Definitions. The following definitions shall apply in the interpretation and enforcement of this 

Ordinance: 

AIR GAP SEPARATION — Means the unobstructed vertical distance through the free 

atmosphere between the lowest opening from any pipe or faucet supplying water to a tank, 

plumbing fixture, or other device and the overflow level rim of the receptacle, and shall be at 

least double the diameter of the supply pipe measured vertically. 

APPROVED — Means that a backflow prevention device or method has been accepted by the 

water supplier as defined by Missouri Department of Natural Resources as suitable for the 

proposed use. 

AUXILIARY WATER SUPPLY — Means any water source or system, other than the public 

water supply, that may be available in the building or premises. 

BACKFLOW — Means the flow other than the intended direction of flow, or any foreign liquids, 

gases, or substances into the distribution system of a public water supply. 

BACKFLOW PREVENTION DEVICE — Means any device, method or type of construction 

intended to prevent backflow into a potable water system. 

CONSUMER — Means protection of the public water supply by installing a cross connection 

control device or air gap separation on the main service line to a facility. 

CONSUMER'S WATER SYSTEM — Is any water system, supplied by or connected to a public 

water system, from the point where it taps into the main supply line to the user's facilities. A 

household plumbing system is considered a consumer's water system. 

CONTAINMENT — Means protection of the public water supply by installing a cross 

connection control device or air gap separation on the main service line to a facility. 

CONTAMINATION — Means an impairment of the quality of the water by sewage, process 

fluids, or other wastes to a degree which could create an actual hazard to the public health through 

poisoning or through spread of disease by exposure. 

CROSS CONNECTION — Is a physical connection or arrangement between two (2) otherwise 

separate piping systems; one of which contains potable water, the other a nonpotable fluid, or 

water or unknown quality, where there could be flow from one system to the other, the direction 

depending on the pressure differential between the two (2). Cross connections may be considered 

as direct or indirect. A direct connection is where the potable water system is physically joined 

to a system containing unsafe water, sewage, or other waste that could contaminate the safe water 

system. An indirect cross connection is a condition where a source of contaminated water may 

be blown across, sucked, or diverted into the potable system. Page 129



 

 

HAZARD, DEGREE OF — Means an evaluation of the potential risk to public health and the 

adverse effect of the hazard upon the potable water system. 

HAZARD, HEALTH — Any condition, device or practice in the water supply system and its 

operation which could create or may create a danger to the health and well being of the water 

consumer. 

HAZARD, PLUMBING — A plumbing type cross connection in a consumer's potable water 

system that has not been properly protected by a vacuum breaker, air gap separation or backflow 

prevention device. 

HAZARD, POLLUTIONAL — An actual or potential threat to the physical properties of the 

water system or to the potability of the public or the consumer's potable water system but which 

would constitute a nuisance or be aesthetically objectionable or could cause damage to the system 

or its appurtenances, but would not be dangerous to health. 

HAZARD, SYSTEM — An actual or potential threat of severe damage to the physical properties 

of the public potable water system or the consumer's potable water system, or of a pollution or 

contamination which would have a protracted effect on the quality of the potable water in the 

system. 

INDUSTRIAL PROCESS SYSTEM — Means any system containing a fluid or solution, which 

may be chemically, biologically, or otherwise contaminated or polluted in a form or concentration 

such as would constitute a health, system, pollutional, or plumbing hazard if introduced into a 

potable water supply. 

INTERCHANGEABLE CONNECTION — Is an arrangement or device that will allow alternate 

but not simultaneous use of two (2) sources of water. 

ISOLATION — Means protection of a facility service line by installing a cross connection 

control device or air gap separation on an individual fixture, appurtenance, or system. 

POLLUTION — Means the presence of any foreign substance (organic, inorganic, or biological) 

in water which tends to degrade its quality so as to constitute a hazard or impair the usefulness of 

the water to a degree which does not create an actual hazard to the public health but which does 

adversely and unreasonably affect such waters for domestic use. 

PUBLIC POTABLE WATER SYSTEM — Means any publicly or privately owned water system 

supplying water to the general public which is satisfactory for drinking, culinary, and domestic 

purposes and meets the requirements of the Missouri Department of Natural Resources. 

REDUCED PRESSURE PRINCIPLE BACKFLOW PREVENTION DEVICE — Is a device 

that contains a minimum of two (2) independently acting check valves with an automatically 

operated pressure differential relief valve between the two (2) check valves. During normal flow 

and at the cessation of normal flow, the pressure between these two (2) checks is less than the 

supply pressure. In case of leakage of either check valve, the differential relief valve, by 

discharging to the atmosphere, maintains the pressure between the check valves at less than the 

supply pressure. The unit includes tightly closing shut-off valves at each end of the device, and 

each device is fitted with test cocks. 

SERVICE CONNECTION — Means the terminal end of a service line from the public water 

system. If a meter is installed at the end of the service, then the service connection means the 

downstream end of the meter. 

Page 130



 

 

WATER SUPPLIER — Means Rolla Municipal Utilities. 

(c) Cross-connections prohibited. 

(1) No water service connection shall be installed or maintained to any premises where actual 

or potential cross connections to the public potable or consumer's water system may exist 

unless such actual or potential cross connections are abated or controlled to the satisfaction 

of the water supplier and as required by the laws and regulations of the Missouri Department 

of Natural Resources. 

(2) Connection shall be installed or maintained, whereby an auxiliary water supply may enter a 

public potable or consumer's water system unless such auxiliary water supply and the 

method of connection and use of such supply shall have been approved by the water supplier 

and the Missouri Department of Natural Resources. 

(3) No water service connection shall be installed or maintained to any premises in which the 

plumbing system, facilities, and fixtures have not been constructed and installed using 

acceptable plumbing practices considered by the water supplier as necessary for the 

protection of health and safety. 

(d) Survey and investigations. 

(1) The consumer's premises shall be open at all reasonable times to the water supplier, or his 

authorized representative, for the conduction of surveys and investigations of water use 

practices within the consumer's premises to determine whether there are actual or potential 

cross connections to the consumer's water system through which contaminants or pollutants 

could backflow into the public potable water systems. 

(2) On request by the water supplier or his authorized representative, the consumer shall furnish 

information on water use practices within his premises. 

(3) It shall be the responsibility of the water consumer to conduct periodic surveys of water use 

practices on his premises to determine whether there are actual or potential cross connections 

to his water system through which contaminants or pollutants could backflow into his or the 

public potable water system. 

(e) Type of protection required. 

(1) The type of protection required by this Ordinance shall depend on the degree of hazard 

which exists, as follows: 

a. An approved air gap separation shall be installed where the public potable water system 

may be contaminated with substances that could cause severe health hazard. 

b. An approved air gap separation or an approved reduced pressure principle backflow 

prevention device shall be installed where the public potable water system may be 

contaminated with a substance that could cause a system or health hazard. 

c. An approved air gap separation or an approved reduced pressure principle backflow 

prevention device or an approved double check valve assembly shall be installed where 

the public potable water system may be polluted with substances that could cause a 

pollutional hazard not dangerous to health. 

 
Page 131



 

 

(f) Where protection is required. 

(1) An approved backflow prevention device shall be installed on each service line to a 

consumer's water system serving premises where, in the judgment of the water purveyor or 

the Missouri Department of Natural Resources, actual or potential hazards to the public 

potable water system exist. The type and degree of protection required shall be 

commensurate with the degree of hazard. 

(2) An approved air gap separation or reduced pressure principle backflow prevention device 

shall be installed at the service connection or within any premises where, in the judgment of 

the water supplier or the Missouri Department of Natural Resources, the nature and extent 

of activities on the premises, or the materials used in connection with the activities, or 

materials stored on the premises, would present an immediate and dangerous hazard to 

health should a cross-connection occur, even though such cross-connection may not exist at 

the time the backflow prevention device is required to be installed. This includes but is not 

limited to the following situations: 

a. Premises having an auxiliary water supply, unless the quality of the auxiliary supply is 

acceptable to the water supplier and the Missouri Department of Natural Resources. 

b. Premises having internal cross connections that are not correctable, or intricate 

plumbing arrangements which make it impractical to ascertain whether or not cross-

connections exist. 

c. Premises where entry is restricted so that inspection for cross connections cannot be 

made with sufficient frequency or at sufficiently short notice to assure the cross 

connections do not exist. 

d. Premises having a repeated history of cross connections being established or 

reestablished. 

e. Premises, which due to the nature of the enterprise therein, are subject to recurring 

modification or expansion. 

f. Premises on which any substance is handled under pressure so as to permit entry into 

the public water supply, or where a cross connection could reasonably be expected to 

occur. This shall include the handling of process waters and cooling waters. 

g. Premises where materials of a toxic or hazardous nature are handled such that if 

backsiphonage or back pressure should occur, a serious health hazard may result. 

(3) The following types of facilities fall into one (1) or more of the categories of premises where 

an approved air gap separation or reduced pressure principle backflow prevention device is 

required by the water supplier and the Missouri Department of Natural Resources to protect 

the public water supply and must be installed at these facilities unless all hazardous or 

potentially hazardous conditions have been eliminated or corrected by other methods to the 

satisfaction of the water supplier and the Missouri Department of Natural Resources. 

a. Aircraft and missile plants 

b. Automotive plants 

c. Auxiliary water systems 

d. Beverage bottling plants 

Page 132



 

 

e. Canneries, packing houses, and reduction plants 

f. Car washing facilities 

g. Chemical manufacturing, processing, compounding or treatment plants 

h. Cold storage plants, dairies 

i. Film laboratories 

j. Fire protection systems 

k. Hazardous waste storage and disposal sites 

l. Hospitals, mortuaries, clinics 

m. Irrigation and sprinkler systems 

n. Industries using toxic substances 

o. Laundries and dye works 

p. Metal manufacturing, cleaning, processing and fabricating plants 

q. Nursing or convalescent homes and clinics 

r. Oil and gas production, storage or transmission properties 

s. Paper and paper products plants 

t. Plating plants 

u. Power plants 

v. Printing and publishing facilities 

w. Radioactive material processing plants or nuclear reactors 

x. Research and analytical laboratories 

y. Rubber plants, natural and synthetic 

z. Stockyards 

aa. Sewage and storm drainage facilities - pumping stations ab. Water front facilities and 

industries 

ac. Water loading stations 

(g) Backflow prevention devices. 

(1) Any backflow prevention device required by this Ordinance shall be of a model or 

construction approved by the water supplier and the Missouri Department of Natural 

Resources. 

a. Air gap separation to be approved shall be at least twice the diameter of the supply 

pipe, measured vertically above the top rim of the vessel, but in no case less than one 

(1) inch. 
Page 133



 

 

b. A double check valve assembly or a reduced pressure principle backflow prevention 

device shall be approved by the water supplier and shall appear on the current "list of 

approved backflow prevention devices" established by the Missouri Department of 

Natural Resources. 

(2) Existing backflow prevention devices approved by the water supplier at the time of 

installation and properly maintained shall, except for inspection and maintenance 

requirements, be excluded from the requirements of this Ordinance so long as the water 

supplier is assured that they will satisfactorily protect the water system. Whenever the 

existing device is moved from its present location, or requires more than minimum 

maintenance, or when the water supplier finds that the maintenance constitutes a hazard to 

health, the unit shall be replaced by a backflow prevention device meeting the requirements 

of this Ordinance. 

(h) Installation. 

(1) Backflow prevention devices required by this Ordinance shall be installed at a location and 

in a manner approved by the water supplier and shall be installed at the expense of the water 

consumer. 

(2) Backflow prevention devices installed on the service line to the consumer's water system 

shall be located on the consumer's side of the water meter, as close to the meter as is 

reasonably practical, and prior to any other connection. 

(3) Backflow prevention devices shall be located so as to be readily accessible for maintenance 

and testing, protected from freezing and where no part of the device will be submerged or 

subject to flooding by any fluid. 

(i) Inspection and maintenance. 

(1) It shall be the duty of the consumer at any premises on which backflow prevention devices 

required by this Ordinance are installed to have inspection, tests, and overhauls made in 

accordance with the following schedule or more often where inspections indicate a need. 

a. Air gap separations shall be inspected at the time of installation and at least every 

twelve (12) months thereafter. 

b. Double check valve assemblies shall be inspected and tested for tightness at the time 

of installation and at least every twelve (12) months thereafter. They shall be 

dismantled, inspected internally, cleaned, and repaired whenever needed and at least 

every thirty (30) months. 

c. Reduced pressure principle backflow prevention devices shall be inspected and tested 

for tightness at the time of installation and at least every twelve (12) months    thereafter. 

They shall be dismantled, inspected internally, cleaned, and repaired whenever needed 

and at least every five (5) years. 

(2) Inspections, tests, and overhauls of backflow prevention devices shall be made at the 

expense of the water consumer and shall be performed by a State of Missouri certified 

backflow prevention device tester. 

(3) Whenever backflow prevention devices required by this Ordinance are found to be defective, 

they shall be repaired or replaced at the expense of the consumer without delay. Page 134



 

 

(4) The water consumer must maintain a complete record of each backflow prevention device 

from purchase to retirement. This shall include a comprehensive listing that includes a 

record of all tests, inspections, and repairs. Records of inspections, tests, repairs, and 

overhauls shall be made available to the water supplier upon request. 

(5) Backflow prevention devices shall not be bypassed, made inoperative, removed, or 

otherwise made ineffective without specific authorization by the water supplier. 

(j) Violations. 

(1) The water supplier shall deny or discontinue, after reasonable notice to the occupants 

thereof, the water service to any premises wherein any backflow prevention device required 

by this Ordinance is not installed, tested, and maintained in a manner acceptable to the water 

supplier or if it is found that the backflow prevention device has been removed or bypassed, 

or if an unprotected cross connection exists on the premises. 

Water service to such premises shall not be restored until the consumer has corrected or eliminated 

such conditions or defects in conformance with this Ordinance to the satisfaction of the water supplier. 

Section 6-38 Sewer Laterals.  

All sanitary sewer laterals installed within the City of Rolla, 4" in diameter or less, will be SDR-40, 

plastic pipe. 

Section 6-39.  (Reserved) 

Article VI Swimming Pools 

Section 6-40 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code – Adopted 

(a) There is hereby adopted by the City, for the purpose of establishing rules and regulations 

applicable to and governing all building and construction in the City, that certain code 

known as the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code, 2024 Edition, and the Appendix 

Chapter A of which code not less than one (1) copy has been and now is filed in the office 

of the City Clerk.  Said code, along with all standards and referenced documents therein, 

is hereby adopted and incorporated into the Code of the City of Rolla, Missouri, as if set 

out at length herein.  

 

(b) This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after August 1, 2026. 
 

Section 6-41 Same – Amendments 

(a) 101.1 Title, is hereby amended by inserting the words "City of Rolla, Missouri". 

(b) 103.1 Creation of Agency, is hereby amended by inserting the words “Community 

Development Department” 

 

(c) 105.4.3 Expiration. Delete and replace with: 

Every permit issued, shall be valid for one (1) year after issuance unless work authorized 

by the permit has not commenced within one hundred eighty (180) days after its 

issuance, or if the authorized work is suspended or abandoned for a period of one 

hundred eighty (180) days after the time the work is commenced. At that time the permit 

Page 135



 

 

would become void and re-application would need to be made. A one-time, one-year 

extension of a valid permit may be obtained at a cost of one-half (1/2) of the original 

permit fee. 

(d) 109.2 Schedule of Permit Fees. Add the following language:   

Refer to Article VII.  Fees. 

(e) 109.4 Work Commencing before permit issuance.  Add the following language: 

 Refer to Article VII. Fees 

(f) 109.6 Refunds.  Add the following language: 

Refer to article VII.  Fees. 

(g) 113.4 Violation penalties. Delete and replace with: 

Any person who shall violate a provision of this Code or shall fail to comply with any of 

the requirements thereof or who shall erect, construct, alter or repair a building or 

structure in violation of an approved plan or directive of the code official, or of a permit 

or certificate issued under the provisions of this Code, shall be guilty of a Misdemeanor, 

punishable by a fine of not more than five hundred dollars ($500.00), or by 

imprisonment not exceeding ninety (90) days, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each 

day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate 

offense. 

(h) Failure to Comply.  Delete and Amend as follows: 

Any person who shall continue any work in or about the structure after having been 

served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to 

remove a violation or unsafe conditions, shall be liable to a fine of not less than fifty 

dollars ($50.00) or more than five hundred dollars ($500.00). 

 

(i) A101.3 Membership of board.  Delete and Refer to Section 6-2 (w) of this Chapter. 

Section 6-42 through 6-44. (Reserved) 

 

Article VII Fees 

Section 6-45. Schedule of Permit fees 

(a) Permit fee Valuation and multiplier. 

The IBC Permit Fee Schedule as published by the International Code Council in the 

Building Valuation Data publication shall be used to determine valuation for new 

construction.  The permit fee shall be calculated using Gross Area x Gross Area Modifier 

x Permit Fee Multiplier (0.0033) = Permit Fee. The permit fee multiplier shall be 

increased by 0.0001 annually along with a valuation update with data from the most 

recently published IBC Permit fee schedule as of January 1 of each year, until a minimum 

fifty percent (50%) recapture rate is maintained by the Community Development 

Department and Fire Department in costs related to building inspections and property 

maintenance.  
 

Page 136



 

 

Flat Rate Fee Schedule 

Portable storage building 

over 200 sq. ft. 

$100.00  

 

Tent    $100.00 

Portable Carport $100.00  

Deck, Porch or Stairs $100.00 (residential) $200.00 (commercial) 

Flat Rate Fee Schedule 

Electric Service $75.00 (residential) $200.00 (commercial) 

Mechanical, Electric, 

Plumbing Work 

$75.00 (residential) $200.00 (commercial) 

Pool or Spa (residential) $100.00 (above-ground) $250.00 (in-ground) 

Pool or Spa (commercial)  $500.00 

Mobile Home  $225.00 

Alterations less than 500 sq. 

ft. 

$100.00 (residential) $200.00 (commercial) 

Alterations 501 - 1499 sq. ft. $175.00 (residential) $350.00 (commercial) 

Alterations 1500 sq. ft. and 

larger 

$325.00 (residential) $650.00 (commercial) 

Signs 50 sq. ft. and under  $150.00 

Signs over 50 sq. ft.  $300.00 

Fire Sprinklers  $600.00 

Parking Lot  $250.00 

Communication Tower  $1000.00 

Demolition $100.00 (residential) (plus 

$200.00 deposit) 

$200.00 (commercial + $500 

deposit) 

 Excavation  $25.00 (+$725 deposit)  

(b) Sewer connection and/or tapping fees. 

Refer to Chapter 35. Sewers.  Article V.  Building Sewers and Connections. 

(c) Work without a permit. 

When construction has commenced without a permit, the permit fee shall be twice the 

original amount to cover any additional inspections and time necessary to ensure 

compliance with the code.  

(d) Failure to obtain required inspection. 

When construction has begun under the authorization of a permit, but the permit holder 

has failed to obtain the required inspection, and the construction has passed the stage in 

which the inspection can be reasonably done, then an additional twenty-five percent 

(25%) of the original permit fee (twenty-five dollars ($25.00) minimum) will be charged.  
Page 137



 

 

(e) Failure to obtain Final inspection prior to permit expiration 

A twenty-five ($25) fee will be assessed for a one-time final inspection.  If more 

inspections are required, the permit shall be renewed for fifty (50) percent of the original 

permit fee. 

(f) Deposits required. 

A two hundred dollars ($200.00) deposit will be required on all residential permits and a 

five hundred dollars ($500.00) deposit will be required on all commercial construction 

permits with estimated construction costs greater than two thousand five hundred dollars 

($2,500.00). This deposit shall be refunded after final inspection has been approved 

under a valid and current permit and the Public Works Department has approved all work 

and the condition of the right-of-way. Should the permit expire or final inspection not be 

obtained and approved before permit expiration, the deposit shall be forfeited. 

(g) Reinspection fee. 

A fee of $50 will be assessed for return inspections after the initial inspection and one (1) 

additional inspection. 

(h) Where no work has commenced on an issued permit, a refund may be processed, upon  

written request of same.  Twenty (20) percent of the Building permit fee will be retained 

to cover administrative and plan review expenses. 

Section 6-46. Building permit fee development incentive: purpose.  

The City of Rolla is committed to the promotion of high quality private and public development 

in all parts of the City and to an ongoing improvement in the quality of life for its citizens. As one 

means to achieve this purpose, the Rolla City Council may, in special instances, consider proposals 

to reduce or waive building permit fees. The purpose of this action being to encourage the creation 

of new private sector jobs, to increase property tax valuation, to promote the retention and 

expansion of existing industry and to assist in the attraction of new businesses to Rolla. 

Specifically, the employment of this incentive shall be limited to businesses classified under the 

North American Industry Classification System (NAICS) manual as Sector 31-33 Manufacturing; 

Section 51, Sub-sector 514, Information Services and Data Processing Services; and Section 54 

Professional, Scientific, and Technical Services. Warehouse and distribution facilities will not be 

eligible for this incentive unless they are ancillary or accessory to an eligible business located in 

or near Rolla. 

Section 6-47. Minimum requirements.  

 

(a) Within the context of the purpose stated in 6-48, the City Council may, on a case-by-case 

basis, give consideration to the waiver or reduction of building permit fees as a stimulus for 

economic development. It is the intent of the City Council that said consideration shall be 

provided in accordance with the criteria outlined in this document. Nothing herein shall 

obligate the Rolla City Council to provide this incentive to any applicant. 

(b) To be considered eligible for the waiver or reduction of building permit fees, a proposed 

project must meet the criteria outlined under Subsection (b)(1) or (2), as follows: 

(1) The project involves a minimum increase in real property value of three hundred percent 

(300%) for a new eligible business; twenty-five percent (25%) for an expansion of an 

existing eligible business; or an investment of at least three million (3,000,000) in 

Page 138



 

 

taxable assets; or 

(2) The project will result in the creation of at least ten (10) new jobs within a twenty-four-

month period, directly attributed to the completion and occupancy of the proposed 

project. 

Section 6-48 through Section 6-49. (Reserved) 

 

Article VII – Burglar, Fire and other alarm systems 

 
Section 6-50.  Burglar, Fire, and Other Alarm Systems; Authorization; False Alarm Responses 

and Fees. 

(a) Authorization. 

Permission and authorization is granted to the owners or renters of any business 

establishment, business property, or residential property within the City to install and 

maintain a burglar, fire, or other alarm system that may result in a response by the Rolla 

Police Department, whether or not such system transmits an alarm signal to a police station 

or fire station of the City. Such authorization is subject to the provisions of this Section 

governing false alarms, responses, and fees. 

 

(b) Definitions. 

1. Alarm Subscriber: Any person or entity that owns, leases, occupies, controls, or operates 

an alarm system for the purpose of obtaining a police response. 

a. For commercial properties, the alarm subscriber shall be the business license holder 

associated with the premises. 

b. For residential properties, the alarm subscriber shall be the owner or resident 

responsible for controlling or operating the alarm system. 

2. Alarm System: Any mechanical, electrical, or electronic device designed to signal an 

emergency condition resulting in a response by the Rolla Police Department. 

3. False Alarm: The activation of an alarm system that results in a response by the Rolla 

Police Department when no criminal offense, fire, medical emergency, or other real 

emergency has occurred or been attempted. 

 

The following shall not be considered false alarms under this Section: 

a. Alarm activations caused by severe weather conditions, including but not limited to 

storms, lightning, high winds, or flooding; 

b. Alarm activations caused by electrical power failure, power surge, or restoration of 

power; 

c. Alarm activations caused by verified telephone, internet, or utility service 

interruptions; 

d. Alarm activations resulting from visible evidence of attempted or actual criminal 

activity, fire, or other emergency condition; 

e. Alarm activations initiated by a person acting under a reasonable belief that an 

emergency existed. 

 

 

Page 139



 

 

(c) Alarm Reporting. 

All alarm activations reported directly or indirectly to the City shall be communicated in a 

manner consistent with procedures established by the Rolla Police Department. 

 

(d) Grace Period. 

The first three (3) false alarms occurring at an alarm location within a rolling twelve-month 

period shall not be assessed a fee. 

1. When practicable, the responding officer shall issue a verbal warning to the alarm 

subscriber or responsible party and document the warning in the appropriate police record 

system. 

2. If no responsible party is present and telephone contact cannot reasonably be made with 

the person controlling the alarm system, the Police Department shall issue written notice 

to the alarm subscriber. 

3. Documentation of a verbal or written warning shall constitute sufficient notice for 

enforcement purposes. 

 

(e) False Alarm Fees. 

Beginning with the fourth false alarm within a rolling twelve-month period, the following 

fees shall apply: 

1. Fourth and fifth false alarms: One hundred dollars ($100.00) per response. 

2. Sixth and each subsequent false alarm: One hundred fifty dollars ($150.00) per response. 

Each response shall be considered a separate false alarm regardless of frequency or 

proximity. 

 

(f) Applicability. 

False alarm fees shall apply whenever there is a false alarm as defined above. 

 

(g) Billing and Payment. 

Invoices for false alarm fees shall be issued by the City and shall be payable within thirty 

(30) days of issuance. 

 

(h) Administrative Review. 

An alarm subscriber may request administrative review of a false alarm fee by submitting a 

written appeal within ten (10) days of invoice issuance. Appeals shall be reviewed by the 

Chief of Police or his or her designee. The decision shall be final, subject to any appeal rights 

provided by law. 

 

(i) Failure to Pay. 

1. Commercial alarm systems. Failure to remit payment may constitute grounds for 

suspension, nonrenewal, or revocation of the business license associated with the 

premises, in accordance with applicable provisions of City Code and/or other lawful 

collection procedures. 

2. Residential alarm systems. Failure to remit payment may be enforced through municipal 

citation or other lawful collection procedures. 

 

Page 140



 

 

(j) System Limitations. 

All audible alarm devices shall automatically deactivate within fifteen (15) minutes of 

activation. 

 

Section 6-51.  Same – Responsibility of owner for installation, damages, etc. 

 

The electrical alarm system permitted by Section 6-53 shall be installed and maintained by 

such person at his expense; and the city shall not, in any manner whatsoever, be responsible 

for the installation or maintenance of such alarm system, and the city shall not be liable to 

any person for any damages or injuries which may arise from the installation or maintenance 

of such alarm system. 

 

Section 6-52 Same - Same - Responsibility of city engineer for installation, etc. 

 

That portion of the equipment of the electrical alarm system, permitted by Section 6-53, 

which may be placed on or within any premises which are the property of the city shall be 

installed and maintained under the supervision, direction and approval of the city engineer. 

 

Section 6-53 Same – Service charge. 

 

For the right of having the electrical signal located at the police station or fire station, there 

shall be paid a service charge to the city in the amount of ten dollars ($10.00) per month. 

Such service charge shall be payable in advance, and such service charge shall be paid for 

each installation, that is to say, a service charge for an installation at the police station, and a 

separate service charge for an installation at the fire station. 

 

Section 6-54.  Same – Disconnection, etc. upon failure to pay. 

 

In the event the service charge required by Section 6-56 shall not be paid within a period of 

thirty (30) days after such charge shall become due and payable, the city engineer is 

authorized and directed to disconnect and make inoperative the signal for such electrical 

alarm system. 

 

 

 

 

Page 141

https://ecode360.com/42739630#42739632


Exhibit B 

Section 14-1. International Fire Code - Adopted.  

(a) There is hereby adopted by the City for the purpose of establishing fire control measures 

and other rules and regulations controlling conditions which could impede or interfere 

with fire suppression forces, that certain code known as the International Fire Code, 2024 

Edition and Appendixes A,B,C, D, E, F, G, H, and N of which code not less than one (1) 

copy has been and now is filed in the office of the City Clerk.  Said code, along with all 

standards and referenced documents therein, is hereby adopted and incorporated into the 

Code of the City of Rolla, Missouri, as if set out at length herein.  

 

(a) This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after August 1, 2026. 

Section 14-2.  Same – Amendments. 

(a) 101.1, Title, Amend by inserting the words "City of Rolla, Missouri". 

(b) 103.1. Creation of Agency, Amend by inserting the words “City of Rolla Fire Department”. 

(c) 105.1.6.  Annual permit. Delete. 

(d) 105.1.6.1.  Annual permit records. Delete. 

(e) 105.3.1.  Expiration.  Delete and amend as follows:   

Every permit issued shall be valid for one (1) year after issuance unless work authorized 

by the permit is not commenced within one hundred eighty (180) days after issuance, 

or if the authorized work is suspended or abandoned for a period of one hundred eighty 

(180) days after the time the work is commenced. At that time the permit would become 

void and re-application would need to be made. A one-time, one-year extension of a 

valid permit may be obtained at a cost of one-half (1/2) of the original permit fee. 

(f) 108.2  Schedule of permit Fees.  Amend to add as follows: 
Refer to Chapter 6, Article VI. Fees. 

(g) 108.4.  Work commencing before permit issuance.  Amend to add as follows: 
Refer to Chapter 6, Article VI. Fees. 

(h) 108.6.  Refunds.  Amend to add as follows: 
Refer to Chapter 6, Article VI. Fees. 

(i) 113.4.  Violation penalties.  Delete and amend as follows: 

Any person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any of 

the requirements thereof or who shall erect, construct, alter or repair a building or structure 

in violation of an approved plan or directive of the code official, or of a permit or certificate 

issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a Misdemeanor, punishable by 

a fine of not more than five hundred dollars ($500.00), or by imprisonment not exceeding 
Page 142



ninety (90) days, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues 

after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense. 

 

(j) 115.4.  Failure to comply.  Delete and amend as follows: 

Any person who shall continue any work in or about the structure after having been served 

with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a 

violation or unsafe conditions, shall be liable to a fine of not less than fifty dollars ($50.00) 

or more than five hundred dollars ($500.00). 

(k) 505.1 Address Identification. Delete and amend as follows: 

New and existing buildings shall be provided with approved address identification.  The 

address identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is visible from the 

street or road fronting the property.  Address identification characters shall contrast with 

their background.  Address numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters.  

Numbers shall not be spelled out.  Each character shall be not less that 4” for residential 

and 6” for commercial, with a minimum stroke width of ½ inch.  Where required by 

the fire code official, address identification shall be provided in additional approved 

locations to facilitate emergency response.  Where access is by means of a private road 

and the building cannot be viewed by the public way, a monument, pole or other sign 

or means shall be used to identify the structure.  Address identification shall be 

maintained. 

(l) 505.1.2 Add the following section. Specific Numbers. The approved property address 

shall be those numbers that are determined by the City of Rolla, Missouri. 

(m) 505.1.3.  Add the following section. Applicability. The provisions of this Ordinance 

shall also be applicable to private and non dedicated streets situated within 

developments that require plat approval under the ordinance of the City of Rolla, 

Missouri. 

(n) 505.1.4 Add the following section. Minimum distance: In any instance in which a 

building with address identification is situated a distance of one hundred (100) feet or 

more from the roadway, such street number shall be displayed in a like manner as 

provided herein on a sign located not more than five (5) feet from the right way of said 

roadway. 

(o) 505.1.5 Add the following section.  Penalties: A violation of the requirements of this 

section 505 shall constitute an offense which shall be punishable by a fine not to exceed 

fifty dollars ($50.00). Each day such dwelling or structure shall remain in violation of 

the requirements of this Ordinance shall subject the owner thereof to prosecution for a 

separate offense. 

(p) 903.2.8.  Group R.  Exception:  Amend to add as follows: 

1.   An automatic sprinkler system shall not be required for structures governed by 
Page 143



the 2024 International Residential Code (IRC) as adopted by RSMo 67.281. 

 

(q) 5601.1.3. Fireworks.  Amend to the following exceptions: 

 5. Any individual or organization may discharge fireworks as herein defined, 

without permit, on the 1st, 2nd, 3rd, 4th, and 5th days of July. 

 6. No Fireworks shall be discharged within fifty (50) feet of any stand, booth, or 

other location where fireworks are being sold. 

 7. Every person who shall sell fireworks in accordance with this Chapter shall post 

notice, at his place of sale, a warning that no fireworks shall be discharged 

within fifty (50) feet of such place of sale as per city ordinance and shall post 

notice that fireworks may be discharged within the city limits on July 1st, 2nd, 

3rd, 4th, and 5th. 

Section 14-3. (Reserved) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Page 144



 

 

 

Exhibit C 

Section 28-6.  Weeds.  Amend section by Deleting subsection (c) in its entirety. All other 

subsections remain unchanged. 

 

Section 28-8.  Notice to owner to abate weeds, etc.  Amend to replace the word fifteen (15) with 

the word ten (10). 

 

Section 28-11 International Property Maintenance Code - Adopted 

For the purpose of establishing minimum standards governing the condition and maintenance of all 

property, buildings, and structures; providing the standards for supplied utilities and facilities and 

other physical things and conditions essential to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary, and fit for 

occupation and use; and for the condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy 

and use and the demolition of such structures; the code known as the “International Property 

Maintenance Code, 2024 Edition”, and the Appendix A and B chapters of the City of Rolla, 

Missouri, and each and all of the regulations and referenced standards therein.  Said code is hereby 

referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out at length herein. 

 

Section 28-12 Amendments to adopted International Property Maintenance Code, as follows: 

 

(a) 101.1 Title. Insert ‘City of Rolla, Missouri.’ 

 

(b) 103.1  Creation of agency.  Insert ‘Community Development Department’ 

 

(c) Section 104 Fees. Delete. 

 

(d) 107.4 Violation Penalties.  Delete and amend as follows: 

Any person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply therewith, or 

with any requirements thereof, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not 

more than five hundred dollars ($500.00), or by imprisonment not exceeding ninety (90) 

days, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due 

notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense. 

(e) 108.4 Failure to Comply.  Delete and amend as follows: 

Any person who shall continue any work in or about the structure after having been served 

with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a 

violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than fifty dollars ($50.00) 

or more than five hundred dollars ($500.00). 

(f) 302.4 Weeds. Insert ten (10) inches.  Add the following: 

Premises and exterior property specifically includes adjacent streets.  The property owner 

is required to maintain those areas between the street pavement and the property line. 

 

(g) 304.14  Insect screens.  Insert ‘year round’ 

 

(h) 602.3  Heat Supply.  Insert ‘year round’ 

Page 145



 

 

 

 

(i) 602.4 Occupiable work spaces. Insert ‘year round’ 

 

(j) B101.3 Membership of board. Delete and amend as follows: 

The board shall consist of five voting members appointed by the Mayor.  Each member shall 

serve for 5 years or until a successor has been appointed.  The board members’ terms shall be 

at staggered intervals, so as to provide continuity.  The Community Development Director 

shall be an ex officio member of said board but shall not vote on any matter before the board. 

1.  Members shall be residents of the city of Rolla, except that non-residents currently 

serving on the board shall be allowed to continue to serve in that capacity. 

 

Section 28-13 Abandoned Property Registry 

Definitions.  

As used in this section: 

ABANDONED RESIDENTIAL STRUCTURE — Means any building, including an accessory 

building, including buildings owned, operated, or subsidized by public or nonprofit agencies, 

which: 

(a) Has been unoccupied for a period of at least one hundred eighty (180) consecutive days; and 

(b) Which also meets at least two (2) of the following conditions: 

(1) Not secured; or 

(2) Is fire damaged to an extent which prohibits safe human occupancy; or 

(3) Is the site of loitering or vagrancy; or 

(4) Demonstrates a lack of property maintenance and upkeep as evidenced by one (1) or 

more violations of the City Code; or 

(5) Has been boarded up for at least ninety (90) days; or 

(6) Has taxes in arrears to the City for a period of time exceeding three hundred sixty-five 

(365) days; or 

(7) Has water and/or electricity that has been disconnected; or 

(8) Is structurally unsound;  

(9) Is a potential hazard or danger to persons. 

ACCESSORY BUILDING — Means a subordinate structure on the same premises as the main 

structure, the use of which would be naturally and normally incidental to that of the main structure, 

whether the main structure is an abandoned structure or not, such as, but not limited to, a garage, 

barn or storage shed. 

DIRECTOR — Means the Director of Community Development or his or her designee. 

OWNER — Means any person with a legal or equitable ownership interest in the structure. 

SECURED — Means a building which has all points of entry into the structure either: 

Page 146



 

 

 

(a) Closed by use of windows and doors which are in proper working order, intact, without holes, 

broken elements, and are locked; or 

(b) Secured by sheeting approved for exterior conditions of a neutral color. 

Section 28-20. Registration required.  

Owners of abandoned residential structures shall register such properties with the City and pay an 

administration fee. Registration shall occur upon the building meeting the requirements set forth 

in this article, and in no event more than fifteen (15) days after notice by the City that the property 

is required to be registered. The duty to register an abandoned structure shall not require prior 

notice to the owner by the City. Registration of an abandoned structure does not preclude the City 

from taking appropriate actions to secure the property or to issue orders to repair or abate 

dangerous, hazardous or unlawful conditions or from acting to eliminate an imminent hazard to 

public health and safety. 

Section 28-21. Registration information. For each abandoned residential structure each owner 

shall register with the City and provide the following information on an abandoned structure 

registration form available from the City: 

(1) The common name of the property, if any, and exact street address of each dwelling to 

be registered, including unit number and total number units in the dwelling; 

(2) The legal names of all owners of the property; 

(3) The complete mailing address of all owners; 

(4) Telephone numbers of each owner, including cell phone and mobile phone numbers; 

(5) Date of birth of all owners; 

(6) If the property is owned by a corporation, limited liability company, partnership, limited 

partnership, trust or real estate investment trust, the name, address and phone number of 

the any following shall be provided: 

a. For a corporation, a corporate officer and the chief operating officer; 

b. For a partnership, the managing partner; 

c. For a limited liability company, the managing or administrative member; 

d. For a limited partnership, a general partner; 

e. For a trust, a trustee; or 

f. For a real estate investment trust, a general partner or an officer. 

(7) The full name, address, telephone number, and email address of a local agent or 

representative authorized by the owner to handle the affairs of the property. The local 

agent or representative shall be an individual over the age of eighteen (18) years. For the 

purpose of this subsection, "local" shall mean a person who resides within Phelps County 

and may be one (1) of the owners. If the local representative is not an owner, the owners 

shall provide proof that the local representative is authorized to act on the owner's behalf; 

(8) The reason for vacancy of the property; 

Page 147



 

 

 

(9) The estimated length of time the property is expected to remain vacant; and 

(10) Any plans for restoration, reuse or removal with an accompanying timeline and work 

schedule 

(b) An owner shall notify the City and file an amended form within seven (7) days of any change 

in the registration information required by this section. 

Section 28-22. Registration. [Ord. 4624, §1] 

(a) An owner of an abandoned structure, whether registered or not, shall pay an abandoned 

structure registration fee, the amounts of which shall be two hundred dollars ($200.00) for 

each six (6) months, prorated for the time during which such structure remains an abandoned 

structure. 

(b) The Director shall investigate any property that may be subject to registration. Based upon 

his findings, the Director may register property as a vacant residential structure subject to this 

article. 

(c) Within five (5) business days of such registration, the Director shall notify the owners of the 

registered property by mail at their last known address according to the records of Phelps 

County. Such notice shall state: 

(1) A description of the property registered; 

(2) A description of the abandoned building criteria found on the property; 

(3) The fact that a semi-annual registration fee has been levied on the property; and 

(4) The semi-annual registration fee of two hundred dollars ($200.00) 

(d) Within thirty (30) days of the date of notification, the property owner may complete any 

improvements to the property that may be necessary to remove the property from registration 

under this article and may request an inspection of the property and reconsideration of the 

levy of the registration fee. Upon receipt of a written request for reconsideration of the levy 

of the registration fee which sets out the reasons claimed by the property owner as to why the 

registration fee should be waived, the Director may waive levy of the registration fee 

following timely compliance. 

(e) Appeal of registration and/or reconsideration to Municipal Judge. Within thirty (30) days of 

the date of such notification or within thirty (30) days of the date of reconsideration by the 

Director, the property owner may appeal the decision to the Municipal Judge. The decision 

of the Municipal Judge shall constitute a final administrative decision pursuant to RSMo 536. 

Section 28-23. Registration fee. [Ord. 4624, §1] 

(a) Amount of fee. There is hereby established and assessed a semi-annual fee in the total amount 

of two hundred dollars ($200.00) imposed on all owners of property registered under this 

article. 

(b) Owner responsible. It shall be the joint and several responsibilities of each owner of property 

registered pursuant to this article to pay the semi-annual registration fee. 

(c) Accrual of fee. The registration fee shall begin to accrue on the beginning of the second 

Page 148



 

 

 

calendar quarter after registration by the Director or reconsideration by the Director; however, 

in the event that an appeal is filed with Circuit Court, the registration fee shall begin to accrue 

on the beginning of the second calendar quarter after the final decision of the Circuit Judge 

or court of competent jurisdiction. 

 

(d) Billing procedures—Late penalties. The Finance Department shall cause to be mailed to the 

owner of property registered under this article, at his/her last known address, a bill for the 

semi-annual registration fee. The fee shall be due and payable within thirty (30) days of 

mailing. In addition to any other penalties provided by law, if an owner fails to pay the fee 

assessed for such property within thirty (30) days of the date of mailing, a late payment fee 

of twenty-five dollars ($25.00) per month shall be assessed for each month during which the 

fee remains unpaid. 

(e) Failure to pay fee unlawful. It shall be unlawful for any owner of property registered pursuant 

to this article to fail to pay the registration fee imposed for such property. Any person found 

guilty of failing to pay any required fee shall be punished as provided in the City Code. 

(f) Collection of delinquent fees; lien on property and other effects of delinquent fees; 

foreclosure proceedings. 

(1) Action to recover. In addition to any other penalties provided by law, the City may 

initiate and pursue an action in a court of competent jurisdiction to recover any unpaid 

fees, interest and penalties from any person liable therefore and, in addition, may recover 

the cost of such action, including reasonable attorney fees. 

(2) Lien on property. Any unpaid or delinquent fees, interest and/or penalties, whether or 

not reduced to judgment, shall constitute a lien against the property for which the fee 

was originally assessed until the same shall be fully satisfied. The City Clerk is 

authorized to take all steps necessary to file and perfect such liens as may be required or 

directed by the Director from time to time. 

(3) Obtaining permits prohibited. In addition to any other penalties provided by law, if an 

owner fails to pay the fee assessed for such property, including any late payment fee 

subsequently imposed, within sixty (60) days of the date of mailing of the initial bill, 

said owner shall not be permitted to apply for, obtain or renew any City license or permit 

of any kind until such delinquency has been satisfied. 

(4) Foreclosure. Any registration fees which are delinquent for a period of one (1) year shall 

be subject to foreclosure proceedings in the same manner as delinquent real property 

taxes. The owner of the property against which the assessment was originally made shall 

be able to redeem the property only by presenting evidence that the violations of the 

applicable City Code cited by the Director has been cured and presenting payment of all 

registration fees and penalties. 

(5) Sale of property. Upon bona fide sale of the property to an unrelated party, the lien on 

such property for the registration fees shall be considered released and the delinquent 

registration fee forgiven. 

Section 28-24. Securing residential structures.  

All abandoned residential structures must be secured upon qualifying as an abandoned structure, 

or upon notice that the building must be registered as an abandoned structure, or upon order of the 

Page 149



 

 

 

Director of Community Development or his or her designee. 

(a) A City order to secure an abandoned property shall be complied with by the owner within 

seventy-two (72) hours. If the securing has not been completed or does not comply with the 

requirements for securing the structure under this chapter, the City shall secure the structure 

and the City shall bill the owner of record for all costs incurred, including service fee and 

administrative costs. The amount so billed may be assessed as a lien against the property and 

shall also be a personal debt against the owner of the abandoned property. 

(b) If any structure previously ordered secured and then subsequently secured by the City shall 

thereafter become unsecured without the consent of the City, the City shall re-secure the 

structure. The costs of re-securing the structure shall be assessed against the owner as a lien 

against the property and shall also be a personal debt against the owner of the abandoned 

property. 

(c) Sheeting approved for exterior conditions of a neutral color shall be placed over all points of 

entry on an abandoned structure such that all exterior openings suitable for animal or human 

entry are secured. 

Section 28-25. Right of entry and inspection.  

If the owner has failed to secure a property and it has been secured by the City, the City may enter 

or reenter the structure to conduct necessary inspections to ensure compliance with the 

requirements of this chapter and to determine if there are any emergency or hazardous conditions. 

Section 28-26. Reuse and occupancy.  

No abandoned structure shall be reoccupied until inspected and found to be in full compliance with 

all applicable City codes and a certificate of occupancy is issued by the City. 

Section 28-27. Responsibility for violations.  

All nuisance, housing, building and related code violations will be cited and noticed to the owner 

of record and shall become the owner's responsibility to bring in compliance. If the owner sells or 

otherwise disposes of the property to another party, the new owner shall not be entitled to any 

extension of time to correct or address such violations as existed at the time of sale, transfer or 

conveyance of the property. 

Section 28-28. Penalty.  

A person who fails to comply with the requirements of this article is guilty of an ordinance 

violation and shall be subject to a fine of not more than five hundred dollars ($500.00) or up to 

ninety (90) days in jail, or both, for each offense. 

(a) In addition to any other penalty provided, the City may enforce this article by a suit for an 

injunction. 

(b) Prior to charging any person with violating the registration requirement in Article VIII, the 

City Clerk shall notify the accused of the violation and give the accused ten (10) days to 

register, if the accused shall register within the said ten (10) days then this shall be a complete 

defense to the charge of failure to register. Page 150



The following is a summary of the impactful changes to the International Codes. The 
summaries below are not all inclusive, but does include some of the more significant 
changes.  
 
2024 Code changes as compared to the 2018 International Building Code. 
IBC 110.3.7 Requirements for inspections of weather exposed balconies 
IBC 306.2 Added use groups to F-1 Occupancies 
IBC 307 and 311 New classifications related to distilled winery and breweries. 
IBC 404 Scope of atrium provisions cleaned up and smoke control clarified 
IBC 406 S-2 Parking Garages requiring sloped floors 
IBC 407 Requirements related to doors and corridors in I-2 Occupancies. 
IBC 411 The addition of Puzzle Rooms. 
IBC 414 The use of fire walls to count control areas as separate buildings. 
IBC 503 Clarification on occupied roofs 
IBC 509 Inclusion of storage battery systems as incidental uses. 
IBC 601, 602 Expansion to include Type IV buildings 
IBC 707 Separations of energy storage systems 
IBC 707 Exception for Fire barriers in exit passageways 
IBC 708 Clarification on the use of Fire Partitions 
IBC 903 Sprinkler requirements clarified for several occupancies 
IBC 907 Manual Fire Alarm requirements in self-storage facilities of three stories 
IBC 1006 Egress specifications for Penthouses and occupied roofs. 
IBC 1010 Clarifications to locks and latches provisions. 
IBC 1031 Reorganization of Emergency Escape and Rescue Openings to align with IRC. 
IBC 1107 Accessibility and Vehicle Charging Stations 
IBC 1108, 1110 Assisted Toileting Facilities 
IBC 1208 Minimum sq ft for efficiency dwelling units reduced. 
IBC 1210 Screening requirements for entry to public restrooms 
IBC 1604 Assembly spaces adjusted risk category under specific occupant loads. 
IBC 1605 Load Combinations now reference ASCE 7 
IBC 1606 Dead Loads at roof level clarified 
IBC 1608 Snow Loads align with ASCE 7 
IBC 1705 The addition of several special inspections 
IBC 2303 Specific requirements added for wood truss bracing 
IBC 2902 Clarification on minimum plumbing facilities and gender assignments 
IBC 3103 Special event structures are now included in temporary structures. 
IBC 3115 Recognition of Intermodal Shipping Containers as buildings and safety criteria 
established. 

 

 

 

Page 151



Significant changes to the International Residential Code as compared to the 
2018 adopted code. 

R301.1.4 Provisions for use of Intermodal Shipping Containers added to the code. 

R302.2 Townhouse common wall separations were clarified. 

R302.3 Two-Family dwelling separations were modified. 

R307 Storm Shelters refer to ICC 500 bringing all storm shelters into the same standard 
referenced. 

R310 Smoke alarm locations updated to add location when bedrooms are spread out over the 
building. 

R316 Specific provisions added for habitable attics. 

R318.7.7 Slopes and walking surfaces where water is to drain away from the buildings are 
updated. 

R319 Emergency Escape and Rescue openings was cleaned up and clarifications made for 
installation requirements. 

R321 Window fall protection requirement clarifications updated. 

R324 Glazing adjacent to wet surfaces was clarified. 

R329 Photovoltaic Systems updated with specifications to exempt fire fighter access pathways. 

R506.2.3 Vapor Retarders under concrete slabs have no change from 2018. 

Section R507 Decks received reformatting and bringing in all pertinent information into a single 
section for structural support and load bearing requirements. 

R602.10 Updated language with respect to placement of Braced Wall Panels and Braced Wall 
Lines. 

R609.4.1 Garage Doors require permanent label. 

R703.11 Vinyl Siding requirements inserted into the code. 

G2415.5 Some gas piping fittings have been added to the approved list for concealed locations. 

P2905.3 Length of hot water piping shall be limited to 100’ from source of hot water. 

P3005.2.10.1 Allowance for removable fixtures & removable traps to serve as cleanouts. 

Appendices have been reformatted and renumbered. 

New Appendix for Tiny Houses (BB) and Extended top and bottom plate (BN) construction have 
been recommended. 
 
 
 
 

Page 152



2024 Code changes as compared to the 2018 International Fire Code. 

IFC 320 Addition of Additive Manufacturing (3D Printing) 
IFC 508 Buildings larger than 500,000 sq ft and F-1 or S-1 Occupancies require Fire Command 
Center 
IFC 903, Chapter 40 Distilled Spirits are integrated into the code. 
IFC 903 Allowable uses of NFPA 13R systems are reduced 
IFC 906 Portable Fire Extinguisher allowance in some Group S or U occupancies. 
IFC 907 Addition of Manual Fire Alarm requirement to Public Self Storage 
IFC 907 Low frequency fire alarms required in R-1 and R-2 occupancies. 
IFC 908 Emergency and Fire Alarm Interface requirement. 
IFC 1006 Egress from Occupied Roofs is expanded. 
IFC 1010 Clarification to Doors and Latches requirements. 
IFC 1103 High Rise, Hotels, Motels, and CO detection for existing buildings. 
IFC 1204 Addition of Portable Generator regulations. 
IFC 1207 Electrical Energy Storage System regulations. 
IFC 2404 Removal of the maximum size for spray booths. 
IFC Chapter 31 Cooking and anchoring of tents and inflatable devices. 
IFC 3203 Addition of storage of Lithium Ion Batteries. 
IFC Chapter 39 Expansion of Extraction of Oils from plants. 
Appendix O Valet Trash service in Group R-2 Occupancies. 
 
 
 
2024 Plumbing Code changes as compared to the 2018 International Plumbing 
Code. 

IPC 306.2.4 Tracer wire requirement for buried sewer and non-metallic water lines. 
IPC 403 Plumbing fixture counts adjusted for Group I Occupancies. 
IPC 403 Special locking requirements for multiple user toilet facilities 
IPC 403 Multiple user and single user toilet facilities are allowed in facility calculations. 
IPC 407.2 Bathtub overflows removed as requirement. 
IPC 410.4 Water Dispenser ratio limits are adjusted. 
IPC 504.7 Listing requirements for water heater pans. 
IPC 604 Showerhead flow rate adjusts maximum allowed. 
IPC 901 New chemical waste piping standards. 
RESOURCE A ICC A117.1 accessibility requirements integrated into IPC 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 153



 
2024 Code changes as compared to the 2018 International Mechanical Code. 

IMC 202 Steam bath equipment section added. 
IMC 306 Ladder specifications to rooftop equipment. 
IMC 307 Approved condensate drainage discharge locations. 
IMC 403 Outdoor Air requirements for dwelling units’ alignment with ASHRAE 62.2. 
Chapter 5 More design flexibility with range hoods in Group I Occupancies. 
Chapter 5 Type 1 Hood requirements specified. 
IMC 501 Common exhaust duct requirements when serving separate dwelling units. 
IMC 504 Dryer Exhaust terminations updated. 
Chapter 11 Inclusion of the A2L and B2L refrigerants and associated safeguards. 
Chapter 11 Removal of the ammonia refrigerant systems from the IMC. 
 
2024 Code changes as compared to the 2018 International Fuel Gas Code. 

IFGC 304.12 New section on protection from fumes and gases. 
IFGC 306 Appliance access in attics clarified. 
IFGC 404 Protection of piping clarification in concealed spaces. 
IFGC 404 Non-metallic pipe support allowed allowing flexibility in design. 
IFGC 406 Abandoned piping regulations. 
 
 
2024 Code changes as compared to the 2018 International Existing Building 
Code. 
IEBC 306 Integration of adult changing stations where bathroom spaces are updated. 

IEBC 309 New requirements with exterior combustible coverings on high rise buildings. 

IEBC 503, 805 Voluntary Laterally force resisting system alteration clarity. 

IEBC 803, 903 Smoke compartments in Group I Occupancies. 

IEBC 1006 Clarification on risk category assignments with multiple uses. 

IEBC 1011 Egress and safety standards for occupiable roofs. 

New Chapter 15 for site safety requirements. 

 
 

 

 

 

 

Page 154



2024 Code changes as compared to the 2018 International Property 
Maintenance Code. 

IPMC 303 Two exceptions added to pools and spas. 

IPMC 304.1.1, 305.1.1, and 306.1.1 Clarification on reference standards and criteria for a 
potentially unsafe structure 

IPMC 307 Better structure and alignment with IFC for Handrails and Guards. 

IPMC 310 New section on Accessibility 

IPMC 311 New section on Storm Shelters 

IPMC 606.3 Inclusion of Private Residence Elevator standards. 

IPMC 704 Smoke alarm installations near cooking appliances and replacement guidelines. 

 

Page 155



 

 

 
 
 

 
CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

 

DEPARTMENT:  Police      ACTION REQUESTED:  Motion 

SUBJECT:  Suppressors & Rifles 

PREPARED BY:  Chief Sean Fagan 

ATTACHMENTS:  N/A 

 (CASE/PROJECT #)      MEETING DATE: April 6, 2026 
___________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
Overview:  
Purchase of sixteen (16) rifle suppressors and two (2) patrol rifles to complete our inventory and 
ensure each officer is equipped appropriately. 
 
Background information: 
In FY ’24 and ‘25, we purchased new AR-15 patrol rifles, which are on a 12-yr replacement schedule.  
The purchase was spread over two fiscal years.  At that time, we also furnished twenty-four (24) of 
those rifles with suppressors made for those specific models.  The rifles and suppressors were 
purchased from Black Rain Ordnance, which had been awarded the bid.  We would like to outfit the 
remaining patrol rifles with suppressors and also purchase two additional patrol rifles and suppressors. 
 
Fiscal considerations:  
This year, we budgeted $16,000 for suppressors for the remaining patrol rifles, which was a high 
estimate.  We are also in need of two additional patrol rifles/silencers and can accommodate that 
purchase, if approved, with the leftover budget. Total cost would be $14,518. 

Budget appropriated – $16,000 
Previous allocations - $0.00 

 
Recommendation:   
Motion to approve sixteen (16) rifle suppressors and two (2) patrol rifles from Black Rain Ordnance for 
a total of $14,518. 
 

Page 156



 

 

 
 
 

 
CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

 

DEPARTMENT: Environmental Services    ACTION REQUESTED: Motion 

SUBJECT:   Bid award  

PREPARED BY:  Roger Pankey, Director 

ATTACHMENTS: NA  

 (CASE/PROJECT #) NA                   MEETING DATE: April 6, 2026 
___________________________________________________________________________________ 
Overview: In keeping with the Equipment/Vehicle Replacement Schedule, which was delayed due to 
unforeseen circumstances, the department requests approval for the purchase of two 2025 Freightliner 
chassis from Armor Equipment to be used as rear-load refuse trucks.  

 
Background information: The department began transitioning to automated refuse collection in 2020. 
After delays following receipt of the first automated truck, units two and three were received in late 
2024, and a fourth truck is on order for mid-2026 delivery. Rear-load truck purchases were postponed 
and two of the City’s rear load trucks are no longer cost-effective to maintain.  The plan was to replace 
both trucks next budget cycle.  Due to a recent breakdown of one of the trucks, the department is looking 
to move forward with replacement of these trucks this year. Rather than waiting until October when the 
FY 2027 budget cycle begins, staff recommend purchasing two 2025 Freightliner chassis for $98,900.00 
each and transferring (swap) the existing Loadmaster bodies for approximately $40,000.00 each.  The 
process of doing body swaps would save approximately $70,000 each.  

 
Fiscal considerations: The purchase of these trucks was planned to be in the FY 27 budget, which 
begins in October of this year. Because this is an unanticipated purchase funds will be taken from 
reserves to cover this cost. Purchasing the new trucks now will save the repair expenses of trying to 
keep the existing trucks operating.  
 
Recommendation: Staff recommend Council approve the purchase of two 2025 Freightliner chassis for 
$98,900.00 each from Armor Equipment and the transfer of the Loadmaster bodies for approximately 
$40,000.00 each. 

Quotes received: 
1. Armor Equipment;             2026 Freightliner $98,900 ea. 
2. TCS Trucks;                         2027 Freightliner $129,715.00 ea. 
3. Premier Truck Group;      2025 Freightliner $103,507.00 ea.      ( No longer available ) Page 157



 

 

 

Page 158




